LatestLaws.com

2 | atest
GlLaws.com

Helping Good People Do Good Things

Bare Acts & Rules

Free Downloadable Formats

Hello Good People !

| atestl awes com



of 1882,

- City Civil Court, as the case may be,’ shall be inserted: xy of 1852,

. Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as amended by the
. Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amendment) Order, 1969,

1927 T.N. Act II'I] Pfeﬂzf:ency Small Cause Couits §§9
[TAMIL NADU] ACT No. III OF 1927

[THR tl.’.lissinmcv SMALL CAUSE COURTS ([TaMIL
-NADU] AMENDMENT) AcCT, 1927.] _

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 25th March
1927, and that of the Governor-General on the o
15th April 1927; the assent of the Goverror-General 5
was first published in the Fort St. George GazZetie . y
of the 3rd May 1927.]

An Act to amend the Presidency Small Cause
Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the
Presidency Town of Madras:

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Presidency P
Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to ¢
the Presidency Town of Madras for the purpose herein-
after appearing ;

AND WHFREAS the previous sanction of the 3
Governor-Gerieral has been obtained ; ]

It is hereby enacted as follows

1. This Act may be called the Presidency Small Short title.
Cause Courts ('[Tamil Nadu] Amendment) Act, 1927,

2. (&) In section 47 of the Presidency Small Cause Amendmen
Courts Act, 1882, for the words *suit in the High Court of section 47,
against the applicant’, the words ‘suit_against the Giptral Act
applicant in the High Court or in the Madras City
Cizil Court, as the case may be, shall be substituted;
an :

{6 In section 49 of the same .A'ct, after the words Amendment

. s . i e s of section 49,
‘suit in the High Court’, the words ‘or in the Madras Centra) Act

1 These words were substituted for the word “Madras” by the '

which came into force on the 14th January 1969. -

*4 Por Statémént of Objests and Reasons, ' see Fort St. George
Gazerte, dated the 18th January 1927—Fart IV, pags 2.

|




— i

1955 T. N Act X]I] Preszdmcy Small Cause Courts * 469 S
(Tam:[ Nadu Amendmmt) | SV IR B

e
't

‘[TAMIL NADU] ACT No. ;m OF 1955]2 o

f"

[THE PRBSIDENCY SMALL CAUSB Coun'rs (I[TAMIL NADU]
o AMBNDMBNT) Acr, 1955]

: (Recezvedthe assentof the Govemoron the 22nd Apri! 1955, |
~ first-published in the Fort St. George Gazette on the
27th Aprd 1955.

~ An Act further to amend the Presidency Small Cause" L
. Courts Act, 1882 in its apphcatxon to the State of . -
Tam:l Nadu] | | |

WHBILBAS 1t is nec;ssaryand Cxptmtm funhu toamend | . e
the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 (Central BT

‘Act XV ¢f 1882),in its applicationto the 3[State cf Tamll
“Nadu], for the purposvs hereinafter appearing ;

BE it cnacted in the Sixth Year of the Rtpubhc of =
- India as follows — -

1. (1) This Act may b.. catled the Presidency Small Short title

Cause Courts (1[Tam11 Nadu] Amendmtnt) Act 1955, and
- commencement

(2) Il shallcomeintoforceon such dateasthe State
Govermnent may, by nouﬁcauon in the Fort St. George
Gazerte** appcint. : -

1 These words were substituted for the word * Madras * by
the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as amended by
the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amendment) Order,
1969

2 For Statement of Ob]CCt'i and Reasons, see Fort Si. George
Gazette, Part IV-A, dated the 8th December 1954, pages 333-334,

-8 This expression was substituted for the expression ** State. of
Madras " by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as
amended by the Tamil Nadu Adaptat:on of Laws (Second Amend.
‘ment) Order, 1969. _
" * Cameinto force on thelstJuly_1955. | ' B -

% _Now the Tami_l Nadu Government Gazette.




it . R |

{10 Presden Sl Cotce Cou - TN AGND
(Tail Nod Amendmons) SR

Kt 2, I scetion 7! of e Prosidency iall Cause Gourts
Amendent of > [ scetion 74 of the Prosidency sl Cause Gourt

N {Maniy l ,‘\ " "WV £ RO vt vl f ‘ o
stion], A0t 1812 (Contrab Act RV of 162 herct nlter refned g :
i ' | A ‘- \ 1
Contral Act %V a8 the pn.ncma] Act) for clawses (o and (9), the Following ‘
' of 1882. shall be substituted =
- *the sum of Hseventy Dn ot ;::3;1} £ _f‘pr every ten ;
rupees or part t hereof of the amount or value of the subject~ {
matter.” |
Insertion of f3' After Sec"i‘?_“..,ﬁ‘ Cf the 1}1'%1'@2_1911} Act, the fo‘:lGWi ng !
new sections sections shall be inserted, namely —
72A and 72B
in Central Act
- XV of 1882,
Fees for ceriain . “72-A. No document of any of the kinds specified
applic-tins, 1NLHe Filth Schoedule shallbe filed. oxhi bited v {‘ccordf‘d in,
or shall be reccived or furnished by, il Small Cavse Courtd, i
unless inrespect of suchdocument, the fee spocificd there-
in be paid. f
Fees for 72.B. A fec amountingto onc-hall ofthe fee payable
applications onthe plaint ina suit for the amount or value ofthe relief
,under claimed . ‘“eapplication, including the value of any
80N 38, o], claimed in respect of costs, shall be paid on every ;‘
application made under seetion 38 on which the Small i
Cause Court orders that notice be issucd on the onposite
party, and such notice shall not beissued uniilsuch fee has ;
been paid : %
Provided that where a new tria! 15 ordered (o be held,
the Small Cause Court may dircet that such fue be repaid,
in whole or in part, to the party by whont it has  been i
paid”. o | .
e e e 'E'::.
*Chapter X (sections 7! to 77-B) of, and the Fifth Schedule to, the

Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 (Central Act XV of 1882),
have been omitted by scctions 2 and 3 respectively of the Presidency -
Small Cause Courws, Code of Civil Procedure and Tamil Nady -
Court-Fees and Suits  Voluation (Amendment) Act, 1979 (Tamil
Nadu Act 43 of 1979), T -

1 These words were substituted for the words “ twelve annas *

by section 2 of, and the Sctedule to, the Tamil Nadu Coinage (Alter-
ation of. References) Act, 1960 (Tamil Nada Act 9 of 19603,




- 1955: T.N. ‘Act XTI} Presidency Small Cause Courgs 471 R
. _ - (Tamil Nadu Amendment) = __ -
*4. After section74 of the principal Act,the following Insertion of B

| seétiqns shall bz inserted, namely :— ' ?e\;"iegtjonsMA \
N . o - o in. -
' ' Central Act XV
. _ ' ' of 1882, +

-

“ 74-A. Where the plaintiff or applicant in any suit Costs where

ot application received and registered under seciion 74 POOr person

-succeeds in the suit or application, the Small Cause Court oo

shall caleulate the amount of fee which wonuld have been
* - paid by the plaintiff or applicant if that suit or application

- had not been so received and registered;such amount shall -

b2 recoverable by the State Government from any party
 ofdered by the decree or order to pay the st me, and shall
hzafirst charge onthe subject-matter of the suit or appli-

cation. | -

4

- 74-B. Where the plaintiff or applicant failsinthe procedurs:

suit or application nr where the suit or application is with- where poar
. drawn or where part of the claimis abandoned or where Derson fails,
~the suit or application. is dismissed because the plaintiff

- orapplicant does not appear when the suit or application _ |
~ is called on for hearing,the Small Cause Court shallorder . = bt

the plaintiff or applicant or anypersonadded as a co-plain~ =~ 77 - %ai
tiff tu the suit or co-applicant inthe applicationto pay the .~ o
fee and in'the case of abandonment of part of the claim
the proportionate fee which would have been payable by
the plaintiff or applicantifthe suit or application had not
 beenreceived and registered under section 74. .

. 74.C.Whereth ¢ Small Cause Court finds that a suit of Paymert of -
- application received and registered undet section 74 has feesby .
‘Been instituted unreasonably cr improperly by a next nt‘?’“ _fr:qu S
friend onbehalt of a minor plaintiffor applicant on acause oo rain cases =~ ©
ot acfion which accrued during the minority of such * |
plaintiff or applicant, the Small Cause Court may order -

~the next friend to personally pay the fee. ' .

. * Chsapter X (sections 71 to77-B) of, end the Fifth Schedule . o
to, the Presidency Stnall Cause. Courts Act, 1882 (Ceniral Act - -

- XV of 1882), have been omiited by sections 2 and 3 respectively

. of ithe Presidercy Stnall Cause Courts, Code of Civil Procedure ™

and Tamil Nadu Court-fees and Suits -Valuatlon (Amendment):

Act, 1979 (T amil Nadu Act 43 of 1979). . E




4] J’Preﬁidency il Cause Cour (1955 TN, Act X1

 (Tamil Nadu Amendment)

Procedure 74 1y Where the suit or application abates by reason
| ‘”T;ﬁl?é‘;f ,f;‘,ﬂ of the death of the plaintiff or of any pirson ad.ugﬂ asa
- by paor co-plaimtifl or of the applicant oy of any personaccte asa
person abates cop-applicant, the Small Cayse Cowt she}ll order that tl_lc
- amount of fve which-would have been paid by the plaintiff
or applicant if his suit or application had not buen
received and registered under seetion 74 shall be recover-
gble by the State Government {romthe estate of the decea-

sed plaintiff or applicant. '

Recovery of  T4-E. Wherecanorderis madgeunter seetion 7fT-A,74—B,
amount 74-C or 74-1), 1he Small Cause Court shall forthwith cause
vifee g copy of the decres or  order 1o b forwarded to the
: Collector, .. o muy, without prejudice te any other moce
- of tecovery, recover the amount of fee specified therein
from the personcr propertyliable forthc payment as if it

were anarrvcar of land revenue .

*5. Forsection77of the principal Act,thefollowing

titution . .
Substitution. of ;. +:0ns shall be subsiitutee, namely —

aew sections for
section 77
in Centrai

Act XV of 1882

S “77. If any diflurence arises belween the officer whose
De;;s;ggra?ég duty it is to see that any fec is paid under this Act and
‘anypartyastothe necessity of payinga fec or the amount
thereof,the questionshall bereferred to the Registrar whose
- deciston shall be final except where, in his opinion, the
questionis one of gencral importance in, which case he
shall refer it to the Chiefl Judge. '

- | 77-A. All fees chargesble under this Act shali be
Collection of collected by stamps,” -
fees by stamps. —

*Chapter X (scetions 71 to 77-B) of , and the Fifth Schedule to, the

+ Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 {(Central Act XV of 1882)

have been omitted by sections 2 and 3 respectively of the Presidency

Small Cause Courts,Code of Civil Procedare and Tamil Nady Court-

feas gnd Saits Valuation (Amendment) Act, 1979 (Tamil Nade
kct 43 of 1979). -

o i i o T R LRI

R Ny ey WA

L

K b i

i v




£

. 1955:T.N.'Act XH| Presidency Small Cause Courts 413"~ /=
SETERE R (Tamil Nadu Amendmenty - -
o Co Addition -

. *6. After the Fourth Scheduleto the principal Act, the of a}rgec;e
~ following Schedule shall be added, namely ;— 'ts"héd“t]e- .
Lo e T ..~ toCe
- o T . 'Actx%ra-
* ' c of 1882.

' THE FIFTH SCHEDULE.
|  (See _sebtion.’ZZ-A.)
drticle. | Particulars. - Proper fee. o
1 “Applications for Iapséd deposits
- presented  efter six months

after the date on. whichthe
amount lapsed to the Govern-

. (i) when the amount or Fifty nay. paise] .
. deposit does not exceed - : o
Rs. 50. '

(ify whan the amount or : ‘One rupee.

deposit exceeds Rs. 50
but does mnot  exceed
Rs. 1,000.

(i) when it exceeds ~ Two rupees.
Rs. 1,000, | |

2, Copy or translation of 2 judg-
: ment or order not being or
having the force of a decree— |
(@) if the amount or value Y[Fifty nay. prisce]
of the subject-matter is .
. Rs. 50; or less than
Rs, 50. - |

(b) if such amourt or value Jne rupee.
exceeds Rs. 50.

1 These words were substituted for the words “ eight annas ”

by sectjon ‘2 of, and the Schedule to, the Tamil Nadu
Coinage (Alteration of References) Act, 1960 (Tam,;}] Nadu
Act 9 of 1960). . L _ . o

~* Chapter X (sections 71 to 77-B) of, and the Fifth Schedule

to, the Presidency Small Cause Courts . Act, 1882 (Central Act
XV of 1882), have been omitted by sections 2 and 3 respectively
of the Presidency Small Cause Courts, Code of, Civil- Procedure
‘and Tamil' Nadt Court-fees and Suiis Valuation -(Amendment)

. Act, 1979 (Tamil Nadu Act 43- of 1979).




474 Presidency Small Cause Courts [1955 : T.N. Act X1
(Tuwil Nadue Amemdmeni) -

Article. Particulars. Proper fee.

3 Coov of a decrce or  order : : 3

naving ihe force of a decrec— oo
(@) ifthe amount or  valus HSovonty-five

of the subjeci-matter of payc maisc].

the suit wherein such .

deciree or order is made

is Rs. 30, or less than

Rs. 50,

(b) if such amount o1 value . One rupee and
exceeds Rs. 50, 2qfifty naye
: paiscl.

4  Copy of any document Jiable to
stamp duty under the Indian

Stamp Act, 1899, when left

by any party tc a suit o _ -
procecding in place of the i
original withdrawn— -

(a) when the stamp duty Th> amount

 clargeable on the origi-  of the duty . | ;

“nul dogs not exceed 2[fifly  chargeable on :

naeye paisel. the original.. {
(b) in any other case .. MSeventy-five

‘naye paisc].

S Qepyof any revenue or judicial : i
proceeding  or - order not '
otherwise provided for by this
Act or ¢opy of any acceuni,

-statemient, report, or the like
taken out of the Small Cause
Court-

For every document .. MSoverty<five - ¥
naye paisel.

T O e, S e

1 These words were substituted for the words, *“ twelve
annas ‘‘by sectjon 2 of; und the Schedule to, the Tami
Nadu Coinage (Amu[;nn of References) Act, 1860 (Tami]
Nadu Act 9 of 196G0),

2 These words were substiloted lor the wmd~ “right annas’
by n,ocllon 2 of, and che Schedule 2, fhe T amil Nadn 00113'
- age (Alteration of References) Aet, 1960 (Pami] Nadu Act

g of 1960).




1955 T N. Act XII] Pres;dency Small Cause Courts 475
o " (Tamil Nadu Amendment) | |

A‘rt:_'cl'e. - Particulars. Proper fee. B

6 Vakalstnama or any paper  One rupee and
sign:d by an Advocate signi-  I[fifty naye
fying or intimating thet he  paise].
is retained for a p'-*rty except
where the party is a member
of any of th: Armed Forces
- of the Union not 'in cml
employment. '

" Application to receive and 2[Seventy-five -
register @ suit or an appli- -naye paise’].

cation under section 41 with-
-out -payment or. on perf
payment of fees. mentloned

. 1n sections 71 and 72, L

8 Apphcatmn for a . copy of 3[Twemy-ﬁve
S translation of 9ny judgment, naye parse]
decree or any proceedmg cr
order ot of any other docu-
ment on record,

9. Apphcatlon or petxtlon not 2[Sevcnty-ﬁvp
otherwise provided for in ~ naye paise]. -
this ‘Act.

7. In Article 40 of Ibchodule I-A to the Indian Stamp éclgggggelh% o'tfo

‘Central Act 11 ol

i Act 1899 (Central Act II of 1899), the followmg entries.
shall be omitted, namely »— -

(b)) whep required in suits or One rupee twe

proceedings under the Presi~-  annas,
dency Small Cause Ccurts
- Act, 1882, - -

-8, All suits and proceedings instituted in the Srnall
~Cause Court beforeths commencement of this Act ana Il
proceedings by way of appeal, revision o otherwise arising
 therefrom, whether instituted before or after such commen-
‘cement, shall be governed by the pr.visions ofthe
principal Act as if this Act had not been passcd.

1 These words were substituted for the words “e’ -+t annas” by
section 2 of, and the Schedule to, the Tamil Nadu Coinage

of 1899,

Savmg

 {(Alteration qf References) Act, 1960 (Tamil Nadn Act 9 of 1960).

2 These words were substituted for the words “ twelve
annas * by ibid.

3 Thesc words were. subsmutcd for the wordq “fom annas” by
lbld



602 Presidency Small Cause Couyris [ 1956:T.N. Act XVI
(Tamil Nadu Amendment) - .

JTAMIL NADU]ACT No. XVI OF 1956.2

" [TuE PRESIDENCY SMALL CAuSE COURTS (| TAMIL
S NADU] AMENDMENT) ACT, 1956.]

(Received the assent of the President on the 25th Septembex
N1956 3 first published in the Fort St. George Gazette on
- the 10th October 1956.) o

" An Act further to amend fhe Presidenéy Small Cause Courts
Act, 1882, in its application to the 3{State of Tamil Nadu}.

WHERBAS it is expedient further to.amend. the Presidency |
- Small Cause Couris Act, 1882 (Central Act XV of 1882),
~in its application to the *[State of Tamil Nadu] for the
purpose hereinafier anpearing ; o
- 'BE it enacted in the Scventh Year of the Repﬁ.biic of
| - Indiaas follows :— | -
Short title 1, (1) This Act may be called the Presidency : Small
and extent, Cayse Courts ('[Tamil Nadu] Amendment) Act, 1956,

- (2) It extends to the whole of the *[State of Tamil

o ."Sdbstitut!ol'"": .-2, For section 47 of the Presidency Smuall Causo
L 0;8:;?;&“;‘2‘.} Courts Act, 1832 (Central Act XV of 1882), the following

‘Central Act section shall be substituted, namely :—
XVofigsz,. - . |

; Stay of “ 47, (1) Whare on an application being made under -
procesdings section 41 the ozcupant, within a month from the service -

v an'accupant on him of the surnmons under section 42 or where the
giving security

2 B0 bring suit SLIMOLS had not been personally served oa him, within

“applicant, tion under section 41, enters into a bond as hereinafter .
provided to the satisfaction of the Small Cause Cour.t,_'__the .

. 1These words were substituted fcr tho word ““Madras *
- by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws '
: --bg6t9hc TamilNadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amendment) Order,

- 8PFgrStatement of ()hject;; and Reasons, 568 Fors Sr;' Georee Cuzott B
- PartIV-A, dated the 6th June 1955, page 46, . lf azelte,

, = . 8This expression was substituted for the expression “ State of -

- against a month of his knowledge of the making of the applica- -

Order, 196v, as amended - -

- Madras™ by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as. .

- amended by the Tamil Wadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amends
7 'ment) Order, 1969, - | (Seconc vaen




e e e P g

1956 T. N Act XVI ] Presidency Small Cause 603
Caurts (Tamil Nady Amendmem)

Small Canse Court shall stav further p18ceedings on the
application from the stage reached when the bond was
accepted by the Small C: Ause Court.

(2) The occupant shall, by the bond aforesaid, bmd RN
B hlmself with two sureties, for such sum as the Small Cause ' S
‘Court thinks reasonable, having regard to the value of the =~ =
property and the probable costs of the suit to institute, S
within a month from the date of the acceptance of the, bond
by the Small Cause Court, a suit in the High Court or in.
- the City Civil Court, as the case may be, to estabhsh_ hls

‘title ' to : ‘continue ‘im  possessicn - of  the erty.
and in ‘the ‘event -of such suit’being dismissed, to’ p‘ay* ﬂ‘]e
- appllcaqt the cost tha.t ma.y be(decreed to him in suéh suit.

- (3) Where suchi suit is not‘ instituted within 2’ ‘midiith -
-of ‘the date of the acceptance of the security by the'Small+
" Cause Court or where such suit having been institutéd ..
within the said period is dismissed, the Small Cause Court -
- shall proceed with the apphcatlon from the stage: rea.ched

when security under sub-sectlon (1) was =accepted. - -

(4) A’ decree passed i in such suit aga.mst the apphcant ..
shall supersede the order, 1f any, made up der section 43

(5 Nothmg contained in sectlon 522 shall apply to
:smts under thig/section ™. = - S “«T,.




TAMIL NADU

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
EXTRAORD]NARY PUBLISHED B8Y AUTHORITY

o. 4561 MADRAS, WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 20, 1995
Purattasl 4, Yuva, Thrruvalluver Aandu—2026

Part [V——-—Sectlon A

./..

Tn.tml Nain Acts and Orduuneea.

il qp—— -+ D i - ' .7\._./

B et e et

| | S
_ The following Act of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly received the o- aent ' : ;
of tha President on the 14th September 1995 and is hereby |published = for :
general information :—

ACT No. 26 OF .1995.

An Act further to amend  the Presidency Small Cause Courts Aaot, 1882 and the
3 : Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887, in its application fo the State
» of Tamﬁ Nadu.

* Be 1t "enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tarm] Nadu in the

. 3 Forty-sixth Year of the chubllc of India as follows:— N

b 3 | 1. (1) This Act may be called the Presidency Small Cause Courts and . the Short title,
Provincial Small Cause Courts (Tamil Nadu Amendment) Act, 1995.

extent and
commence-
: ment,
(2) Itextends to the wholeof the State of Tamil Nadu. ' ﬁ
{3) It shallcomeinto force onsuchdate asthe State Government may, by
B notification, appoint.
4 tral Act 2. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882,— - Amendment
& XV of 1882, . ) of Central Act
& ) ) . XV of 1882.
{1) iz section 14, for the words ““‘twenty rupees”, the words *““‘twe hundred
tupees *’ shall be substituted ; . :
(2) in section 18,—
* (@) in the opening portion, fo1 thc words “‘two thousand rupees”, the words
“twenty thousaud rupeos”’ shall be substituted;
(b) in the Exptanatlonl for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words
"twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;
(A GI'OIJQ) IV'2 BK. (456) -y 95y S ree oty ;
. i o1, DU I ro o T . l

e Lo o At e = o¥LoEF VI YR o7y M Mo v e m



6 TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

B0 s e

R (3) ir section 20, in the first paragraph, for the words “two thousand rupees”
occurring in two places, the words* ‘twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

£4) in section 21, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “tem thou-
sand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(5} in section 22,—
=T . (i) for \he words “one thousand rupees”, fthe words “ten  thousand
rupee:” shall be substituted ; : -

v (if) for the words “tbree hundred rupees”, the words “three thousand
rupees!’ shall be substituted ;

-"{'6) in section 39, in sub-section (1), for -the words “ore thousand rup'ees”,
*ne words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

' (7) in section 41, for the words “two thousard rupees™, the words “five
thewsand rupees” shatl be substituted ;

() in section 45, in the second paragraph, for the words “ten rupees”, the
werds “one hundred rupees” shall be substituted

%) in section 63, in the first paragraph, for the words “one thousand
repees”, the words “two thousand and five hundred rupees” shall be substituted ;

. £18) in section 69, in sub-section (1), for the wdrds “five hundred rupees”,
the words ““two thousand and five hundred rupees’”” shall be substituted ;

(11) in section 76, for the words ““twenty rupees”, the words “‘two kundred
rupees” shall be substituted,

ymendment of 3. In the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887,~-

Ceniral Act E
Central Act H(EOf 1387 ':.
IX of 1887, ' 3

(1} in section 12, in sub-section (3), for the words ‘twenty rupees”, .the
words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted ;

(2) in section 15,~-

. {i) in sub-section (2), for the words ¢ five hundred rupees ™, the words
“#ive-thousand rupees® shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (3). for the words “one thousand rupecs”, the words ©five

thousand rupees” shull be substituted ;
"_IF N .
(3) in section 28, in sub-section (7), for the words *five thousand rupees”,

the words “thirty thcusand rupees’” shatl be substituted,

Jramsitory 4; (1) All suits afhd proceedings of which the amount or value of the subject-
provision, matier exceeds rupeef two thousand but does not cxceed rupees twenty thousand
and pending in the Madras City Civil Court, immediately before the date of the
Commencement of this Act, shall be heard and disposed of by the Madras City Civil

Cou-t, as It this Aqt had not been passed.

;o (2) All suits and procecdings of which the amount or value of the subject-
matlsy exceeds five hundred rupees but does not exceed five thousand rupees and
pending in any court of the District Munsif, immediately before the date of -
the commencement 'of this Act, shall be heard and disposed of by such court of
the - Jistrict Munsif as if this Act had not been passed.

(By order of the Governor.)

M. MUNIRAMAN.
Secretary to Government, Law Pepartwent,

e e L - . T T . " st -

T R M Y o b

<=~ PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE PIRECTOR OF STATIONERY AND PRINTING, MADRAS.
. r"% “anttis, i ON BENALB GF THE GOVERNNENT OB TAMIL NADU. - - —-touoma




	1927TN3.pdf
	1927TN3.pdf
	1955TN12.pdf
	1956TN16.pdf

	1995TN26.pdf

