
LatestLaws.com

LatestLaws.comLatestLaws.com

LatestLaws.com
LatestLaws.com

 

 

 

 

Bare Acts & Rules 

Free Downloadable Formats 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Hello Good People ! 

LaLas 

LatestLaws.comLatestLaws.com

LatestLaws.comLatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

192% T.N. ~ c t  Presidency small C ~ S I  Courts 24% 

i~~~~ , - N ~ U ]  ACT $To. 111 OF 1 9 2 ~ .  - .  

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 25th March 
1927, and that of the Governor-General on the 
15th April 1927; the assent of the Goverzou-Generfil i' 
wasjirst published in the Fort St. George Gazette 
of the 3rd May 1927.1 1 , 

1 

An Act to amend the Presidency Small Cause 
4; 

Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the 
Presidency Town of Madras. i 

I 

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Presidency 
rS 
.; 

Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to 
the Presidency Town of Madras for the purpose herein- 
after appearing ; 

AND WHEREAS the previous sanction of the 
Governor-General has been obtained ; 

It is hereby enacted as follows :- 

1. This Act may be called the Presidency Small Short title. 
Cause Courts ('[Tamil Nadu] Amendment) Act, 1927. 

2. (a)  In section 47 of the Presidency Small Cause Amendment 
Central Courts Act, 1882, for the W O I ~ S  'suit in the High Court of section 47. 
ActXV against the applicant', the words 'suit against the Central ~ c t  
Of 

applicant in the High Court or in the Madras City 
XV of 1882. 

Civil Court, as the case may be, shall be substituted; 
and 

(b) In section 49 of the same Act, aher the words Amendment 
(suit in the High Court', the words 'or in the Madras g22:i\02'9* 
City Civil Court, as the case may be,' shall be inserted xv 1882. 

1 These words wore substituted for the word "Madras" by the 
Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Odcr, 1969, as amended by the 
Tamil Nadu Ada tation of Law (Second Amendment) Order, 1969, 
whi& came into hrw on the 14th January 1969. 

, , ' 6 Fbr Statimdnt of Objects and Reasons, see Port St. George 
$ .I hot to ,  dated tho 18th January 1927-Part N, paps 2. 

\ 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

,1955: T .N. Act xG] ~residrncy Small Cause *Courts ' 469 , 
I 

. (Tamil Nudu Amendment) . 
i - 

. . 
. % J  , -;. '-. ' 

, 1 

* F: . 
I ' . ! c.'? 

i.: 

I ,  - 
a. 

> '  . 

#PAMIL NADUJ ACT No. P I  OF 195512 - 
. (;A 

i-* 
. , , . 

, 
( ; .  ., : +i 

* 4,, :. 
[THE PRBS~DBNCY SMALL CAUSB COURTS ('[TAMIL NADG ' , . . " .a (  > d 

AMVIIMDMBNT) ACT, 19551. . . .-*I 

(Received the assent of the Governor bn the 22rd April 1955, 
first published in the Fort St. George  gazette on the , 
27th April 1955. I 

- 1 
8 5  . ' I ' 

\ 
; I 

An Act further to amend the Presidency Small Cause * - -  I 
Coarts Act, 1882, in its application to the a[State of I 

Tamil Nadu]. 
- / 

+< y 
W~~l~e~sitisnecc~~aryandexpc'icntfu~lht~ toamend ' . 

- the Presidency Sn~all Cause Courts Act, 1882 (Central 
Act XV clf 1882),in its  application!^ the a[State cf Ta&il 
Nadu], fclr the purposts hereinafter appearing ; 

b 

BE it enacted i n  the Sixt 11 Year of [he R~public of 
India as follows :- - 

I. (i) This Act may bc called the Presidency Small Short title ' 

Cause Courts (l[Tamil Nadu] Amendment) Act 1955. and 
commencement. , 

(2) It shallcome into force on such date a.i the State 
Govern~ncnt may, by notification i n  t lie Fort St. George. 
Gazette**, appoint. 

I 

1 These words were substituted for the wo,.d " Madras ? by 
the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as amended by 
the Tamil Nadr, Adaptation of Laws (Second Amendment) Order; 
1969. 

2 For Statement of Objects and Reasons, see t o r t  Sf. Georfie 
Gaz~tte,'Part IV-A, dated tllc 8th December 1954, page.; 333-334. 

This expression was substituted for the exprcssioil " State, of 
Madras '' by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws Older, 1969, a3 

prnended by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amend- 
ment) Order, 1969. 

* Came into force on the 1st Jaly 1955. 
I 

I 
** Now the Tamil Nadu Government Gazette. I 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

9 111 seclio n 71 of iht PI t aii,ic'~'icj ?inaii [lust bur IS 
Amendment of r I R 

''1'111 , Act, 11112 (Cairai i c i  XV of ibbi,;;iii.t:i iaf i i .~ [([(lrtd (0 section 71, t t I I 

CdDtral Act YV as the p c ~  nclpal Act), !or dausci ( d j  1 a id (j), t 1% followi llg 

of 1882. shall be s ~ l ) s ~  i t  utccl :-- 
I' 

I =  - j h 4 r i c  e l  !'or every ten " t hc buln of L I  sev~l l ty  *,, . , .. L - .) 

rupees or part t hcrcif of the amount or value oi't hr subject- 
matter ." 

Inser~ion of 
$3. After scc,ioi-r 72 af thc: plilicipal Ac!, the fofluwing 

new sections sections shall bc inserted, nanlcly :- 
72A and 7213 

in Central Act 
XV of 1882. 

c c  72-A. NO ~ i ~ ~ ! t ~ . n e ~ l t  of any of t he kinds specified 
Fees for ceriain 

applic : t i  in t l~c  Fill11 Scl~irIujk blr; l l l  bc l i l c c l . r x I ~ i h i ~ ~ ~ ~ ~  1 I tccoldrcl i n ,  
or shall bc i cccivcd c:r I'ur~li>,J~c'c' lltp, i, 111 ! ; ~ i i i )  f f C'ILLI:.C C(,UI 1, 

unless in  rcspcc: of such do~urnc j6~  r ilc i;.e s~ccified there- ( 

in be paid. s 
f 

Fees for 72.B. Afee alcountingto o i ~ ~ - h n l l  of'the fee payable 
applications on the pIaiqlt i n  a sttit. fur- tht  iilnon nt oi- callic orthe rcliof 

under claimed k t .  ' l?c application, including t l s  value of any 
E ~ : ~ J ~  3s0 r ~ l , ~ ;  clairncrl i n  rcapcct of cosi s, shall ba paid on every 

a~plication nr:!c?c u t1c4c.1. xcction 38 on which the Small 
Cause Owrt onlc.~ 5 t hat notics b? i s~uc(1  nu r he c!,posite 
party, and  such I . Io~~c{:  :lllall not be i:,:.ac-'ci u m i l  such fee has 
been paid : 

B 
Psovidcd, that i1f1lzi.c.. a nc*w t~ iuf  iil oscic~~c)  to be I~cld, 

thc Small Causc C'UI.! rltaydircct (hat such  1;c bc ~cpaiti ,  f in wholc or i 11 pal-1, t4.j i hc party !,y wiioni i t  has bcen 
paid ". 1 

*chapter X (sectioos 71 to 77-0) of, and ihe.Fiftb Schedule to, the 
Presidency Small Cause C u ~ ~ r t s  Act, 1882 (Central Act XV of 1X82), 
have been omitted by scctions 2 and 3 I-espeutively of the Presic!ency . 
Small Cause Coura, Cocle ,jf Civil Prt~edurc and Tamil Nadu - 
Court-Fees and Suits Vz1:tation (Arncxadrne~~l) Act, 1979 (Tamil 
Nadu Act 43 of 197,). 

f These words were substituted for the words " tw=lve annas '' 
by section 2 of, and the ScFcdule to, thc Tan$] Nadu Chinage (Alter- 
ation of References) Act, I960 (Tamil Nadu Act 9 of f 960). 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

1955: T.N. 'Act XII] ~ r i i d e n c y  Small C a m  Gourts 471 I 

. (Tamil Nadu Amendment) 
*4. After section 74 of the prinCiprrl Act,  the following Insertion of 

sections shall be inserted, namely :- ' new sections 74A 
to 74-E in 
Central Act XV 

C 

A 
of 1882. 

" 74-A. Whzre the plaictiff or applicant in  any suit Coats where 
poor person or application received and registered under seci ion 74 sUccaeds. 

succeeds in the suit or application, the Small Cause Court . . 
shall calculat t the amount of fee which wollld have been . 
paid by the plaintiff or applicant if that suit or application ' . ' 
h3d not been so received and registcred;such amount shall 
be recoverable by the Stzte Government from any party 
ordered by the decree or order to pay the sr me, and shall 

- $safirst chargeonthesubject-matter ofthesuit orappli- 
cation. 

74-B. Where the plaintiff or applicant fai 1s in the prOcedGre 
suit or application or where the suit or application is with- where poor 
drawn or where part of the claim is abandoned or where person fails. 
the suit or applicaition is d.ismiss'ed because the plaintiff 
or applicant does not appear when the suit or application 
is called on for hearing, the Small Cause Court shall order . i 

-. 

the plaintiff or applicant or any person added as a co-plain- - t . -  3 . - T , ~ ~ ~ ~  

tiff tu  the suit or co-applicant in the applicai ion to pay the 
, . + f  

fee and in the case of abandonment of part of the claim . . + t  t rf.. , , 

- the proportionate fee which would have been payable by , $ . . .  

the plaintiff or applicant if t he suit or applical ion had not 
,- . 

been received and registered under section 74. +:< , 

. a  - - .  ,$" 
I .  . - : . ..icy + - * . :,L;*Ci 

: ,I. 4'.., 

r .  
> ,  ..- , ' t  ,;",q$ . * * u  

.74-C. Where th e Small CauSe~-Court finds that a suit or' paymec; o f  - ?.% 
application received and,registered under scction 74 has fees by . 2: ig < 

, b' t 
&en instituted unreasonably c#r improperly 'by (r next of next minor friend in 

hf . 

friend 'on behalf of a minor plaintiff or applicant on a cause certain cases. - - : 

ot action which accrucd during the minority of such 
plaintiff or applicant, the Small Cause Coirrt may order 
the next friond to pxsonally pay the fee. 

* % 4 

..-. i 
1 1  

5 -- " . . - 
. . * Chnpter X (seci ions 71 to -77-B) af, rnd the Fifth Schedule 

' t ~ 1 ,  the Presidency Smsll Cause Courts Act, 1882 (Cenfrzl Act , ' . t i .  

XV of 1882), heve been omitted by sections 3- and 3 respectively . . 'I- , 
of the Presiderxy Stnall Cause Courts, Code of Civil Procedure . . ' *  

and Tamil Nsdu Caurt~fees and Suits -Valuation (Amendment). 
Act, 1979 (Tamil Nadu Act 43 of 1979). . . 

r 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

''acedure 744). Wllele ihc suit or apylicalion abat cs by ft+iirOV. 
where suit or 

application of the death OF tho plaintiff 01. 61 any 1,i r w n  adc~ id  as a 
b y  paor co-p]aintiiI'or oft  hi applicant o r  c,+i any 1)crsoJl a d i i i  as a 

Person abates co-applican!, thc Slilall Cause Corllt shall ordcr t hat ihc 
amount oi5i;c whicli,would havc bccn paid by the plaintiff 

l or applicant il' his s u i t  or application had not b ~ e n  
received and rcgi~k+:+cc! und cr scciioll74 3 ha 11 be rtcover- 
qble by thc Stlitc Govcsnment i'romtilc. catate oft  he dccea- 
sed plaintiff or applicant. 

Recovery of 74-E. Whelc an order is nwdc u n d ~ r  scction 7;-h, 74-B, 
amount 74-C or 7443, I, hc Small Cause Court 511u11 fc r t  tw i t  h cause 

fee a copy o f  tllc dcc, 4 . i :  or ol.ucr t o b!: fol-wart1 cd to the 
Collector, . '10 rimy, willlout prc j~~d icc  tc a l l y  othcl- muc-c - of ~ccovcry, recovcr I hc amount o S  fce spccificd thercin 
from t ht, pcl son c:r property liable for I lic pay~llent aa if it 
were an al-I-car- of la rlct I-cvunuc."'" 

*5 .  For section 77 of the principal Act, t 'ri~ hllowing 
Substitution Of sections shall be subsiituteo, namely :--- new sections for 

section 77 
in Central 

Act XV of 1882 

"77. If anyc:ilTWr.cncc: arists b ~ t w c c n  tlzc officer whose 
Decision astoduty it  is t o  set tllat any  fec is pikid undcr this Act and 

proper fee.. 
any party as to t hc n~:ccsaity cl'paying a fec or the amount 
thcrcof, thc quest in11 sha11 be rcfcrred to t hc Rtgistrar w11ose 

- decision shall be fit~nl cxcept wllcsc, it1 his opinion, the 1 r 
questio~l is one of g c n ~ r a l  i~uportancc i n ,  which case he i 
shall refer it to the Chief Judgc, 

E 

p 
77-A. All fe-s c'larpoble undcr t hi; Act ~11311 be 

.Collection of collected by stamp?.!' i: 
fees by stamps. 

i 
Y -- I_----- -.___1- .-" 

'Chapter X (sections 71 to 77-B) of. and the Fifth Schedule to, the 1 
Presidency Small Causc Cuurts Act, 1382 (Central Act XV of 1882) 
bave been omi tteci by ~ecr  ic);~s 2 and 3 rc~pcctittcly of the Presidency 

i 
Small Cause Courts,Cr .fc of Civil ProcctIurqand Tnfnii Nadu Court- 1 
fees and Suits V,?lt~nti(,n (Amendment) Act, 1979 (Tamil Nadu 
h ct 43 of 1979). 1 

f 
t 

Q 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

. , f 

*) - - 
.# * _ -  II - - .- -- --_ -- - - - --A 

8 ,  , * -  . 
, 1955: T .N . ~ c t  xII~ Presideficy ~ n i a l l  cause court; 473 

(Tamil Nadu Amendment) . 
Addition 

*6. After the Fourth Schedule to the principal Act, the of a;new 
- following Sctedclc shall be added, namely :- Schedule 

- to Central 
Act XV ". 

s of 1882. 

THE FIFTH SC~EDULE..  . - 

(See section 72-A.) 

'Article. Particulars. Proper fee. 

1 Applications for lapsed deposits 
prcsentcd pfter six montlis 
afrcr the date on which the 
amount lapsed to the Govern- 
ment- a 

(i) when the amount or l[FiWy nay, paise] 
dcposit does not exceed 
Rs. 50. 

(ii) wh:n the amount or O l ~ e  rupee. 9 

. . deposit exceeds Rs. SO 
but does not exceed . 

Rs . 1,000. 

- - 

_ _ -  - - . I -  -- - 
1These words were substituted for the words " eight annas " 

by sect#jon 2 of, and the Schedulo to, the Tamil Nadu 
Coinage (Alteration of References) Act, 1960 (Tamil Nadu 
Act 9 of 1960). . 

* Chapter X (sections 71 to 77-B) of, and the Fifth Scl~edule 
to, the Presidency Small Cause Courts. Act, 1882 (Cemtral Act 
XV of 18821, have been omitted by sections 2 and 3 respectively 
of the Presidency Small Cause Courts, Code of. Civil Procedure 
and Tamil Nadc Court-fees and. Suib Va!uatbn .(Amendment) 
Act, 1979 (Tamil Nadu Act 43 o f  1979). . . . I .  

(iii) when it exceeds Two rupees. 
Rs. 1,000, , 

2. copy or translstion of at judg- 
ment or order not being or 
having the forre 0f.a decrbc-- 
(a) if the amount or vdu e l[Fifty m y~ p dsd 

of the subject-matter is 
RP. 50; or less than 
Rs. 50. 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

474 Presi&ncy ~ l d l  Cil~sr CU(O~~Y(.C 11955 : T.N. Act Xn 
( 1  Nddld d f ! ? t 4 f / l ( , / l ; l e ! l l )  

Article. ' Paviiczilars. Proper f ie.  

3 COnv ol' a d c c r t : ~  or c,rdcr 
~naving the hwcc of a tlc;cre~-- 

(a) if th;: amount oi- virlu,, J[S,v;niy-fiv~ 
of t.hc subjcci-matter of ilayi ;)i?isL]. 
thc su i i  wl~ereitz such 
deciee or ordcr -is ~nai?c 
is Rs. 50, or less 4 lzxn 
Rs. SO. 

(b) if b u ~ h  amount ul valu:\ One ruper: and 
excueds Rs. 50. "fifty naye 

p~tisu]. 

4 Copy of any aocumcnt liable to 
st~ltlp duty under the ! ndiia~~ 
Stamp Act, 1899, when left 
by any p : ~ t y  to a suil 01 

proceeding in  place of th.: 
original withdr~wn- 

(a) whcn the stamp duty Th: am:)unt 
cl .argcablc on the origi- of the duty 
nu1 docs not exceed Z[fifiy charge.;..bie 011 

a ~ y e  pi6 s t*] . t h;: origin:!i. . 

(b) in any othcr case , , l[S;vl=nty-fi~c 
naye paisd. 

5 <kpy of any revenue or jud icial 
prcceedirlg or order not 
otht:rwiso providcd for by this 
Act or c.)py or any acccunt, 
staterneat, report, or the like 
takcn out of thc Smp. 11 C:itlsc 
Court- 

For every doculnei~t . . '[S-vei7 ly-five 
n:lyt: paisq. 

P -- YI- -.---*--.I.---- 

1 These words weru substituted for thc worcls . "'twelve 
annas "by  ~ ~ ~ t ~ i o l l  2 of j  and the t f  t o  the ' ~ a m i !  
Nadu Coinagr (A ]  jt!ri* 1 ~ O I I  of R ~ f e :  O I ~ C C S )  .Ic~, !9GO (rJ'iln>il 
Natlu Act; 9 o f  l!ltiO). 

BThesc woixir I V C ~ I L ~  :~ibsiituted for tlic word:. '.cigllt atinas " 
. ~ y  sect'on 2 0 1 ,  ;111(1 t i :  i%~llc(l l l ]cl  2 hd !JVi~inil N;idn Coin- r age (A teration of I t t ~ l i y r u ~  ea) A:t, I!)BO ~~i 'arnj  1 Nadu Act 
9 of 1960). 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

1955 : T*H.Aet XI11 Preszdency Small Cau~e Comts' 475 a 

(Tamil Nadu Amendment) - 
Articfe. Particulars. Proper fee. 

6 Vakal~tnama or any pspcr One rupee and 
sign:.d by an Advocate signi- l[fift)t naye . 
fying or intimating t h ~ t  he paise]. ~. 
is retained for a p?rfy4except 
where the party is a membar 
of any of th: Armed Forces 

" of the Union not .in civil 
employment. . , -. 

. 7 -  Application to receive and 2[Seventy-five . - r <  +, 

r i 

register a suit or an appli- naye paise"]. , % ; z.. 
L&%' 

cation under section 41 with- ' , .,.'.+ <.Ri 4 
out payment or on part < 7-% :;$ 

paymetht of fees mentioned ,. fr$+ 
>,z.. 

in sections 71 and 72. I . .  . -, r . Y  %..M+. 

' . t r* '  8 ~ ~ ~ l i c a t i o n  fcr a copy of a[lrweniy-five ," 

translation of e ny judgment, na ye paise]. I - r  

decrcc or any procetding cr k 

order or of any other docu- 
ment on record. 

9 Application or petition not ?[Seventy-five 
otherwise provided for in naye paise]. : 
this Act. 

7. In  hrticle 40 of Schedule I-A to the Indian Stamp Amendmefit of. ' 
Schedule 1-A %O . Act; 1899 (Cent r;?l Act I1 of 1899), the following entries Act 

shall be omitted, namely :-- o f  1899. 

" (b) w h e ~  required in suits or One rupee two 
proceedings under the Presi- annas. 
dency Small Cause Ccurts 

, Act, 1882. 

8. All suits and proci.ediirgs instituted in the Small Saving. 
Cause Court befornhc commencement of this Act ana 211 
proceedings by way of appeal. rey;ision or. otherwiss arising 
therefrom, whether instituted before dr afttr such cominen- 
cement, shall be governed by the pr #visions ofthe 
principal Act as if t his Act had not been passed. 

-- 
1 These words were substituted for the words ''e:,-"f annas" by 

section 2 of, and the Schedule to, the Tamil Nadu Coinage 
(Alteration of References) Act, 1960 (Tamil Nadg Act 9 of '1 960). 

2 These words were substituted for the words '' twelve 
annas " by ibid. 

8 Tl~csc words wcrc .substituted for the nords "four annas" by 
ibid. 

9 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

602 Presidency Small Cause Court.; [ 1956:T.N' Act XV1 
(Tamil N R ~  Al~zendtnent) 

I .  '[TAMIL NADU] ACT No. XVI OF 1956.2 
, - ' : 

, . [n-I.J3' PRBSIDGNCY SMALL C AUSB COURTS ('['TAMIL ' 

< .  NADUJ A ~ N D M B N ~ ~  ACT, 1956.1 

(Received the assent of the President on the 25th September 
' 1956 : first published in the Fort St. George Gazette on 

the 10th October 1956,) 

An Act further to amend the Presidency Small Cause C u ~ t s  

I - Act, 1482, in its application to the J[Strte of Tamil Naduj. 

WHEREAS it is ex~edient further to amend the Presidency 
Small Cause Courls Act, 1882 (Centl.al Act XV of 1882). 
ili its application to the 3[State of Tamil Nadu] for the 
purpose hereinafter appearing ; 

Be it enacted in the Scventll Ycar of the Republic of 
India as follows :- 

Short title 1. (1) This Act may be called the Presidency \ Small 
and extent. Cause Courts (I  [Tamil Naduj Atncndment) Act, 1956. 

2) It extends to the whole of the "State of Tamil d N u]. 

Subatitutb. ' . 2. For section 47 of the Presidency Smitll Cause 
I of now 

lo* ~ o u i t s  Act, 1882 (Central Act X V of 1882), the Pollo Mq 
6 for swti011 47 

, t : w r d  section shall be substituted, namely :- 
W' - * _ .  :, . - XV of 1882. 

* , l  

3 ., 

, ' . " 47. (1) Wh 3rc on an application being lnade u d k  
section 41 the o %upant, within a month from the service 
on him of the surnmons under ' section 42 or where the 
summons had not been personally served on him, within 
a month of his kno ~lcdge of the making of the applica- 
tion under section 41, enters into a bond as he~ei&er 
provided to the satisfaction of the Sinall Cause Court, the 

, iThese words were substituted fear the word '%&drtls " 
by the Tamil Nadu Adaptation af Laws, Order, 1969, as qrnendd 
by tho TamilNadu Adaptation of Laws (Second Amendment) Orda, 
1969. @ 

. aFor St at emant of O hjocts and Reasons, sm Forr St. George Gazette, 
Part IV-A, dated the 6th June 1956, page 46, . 

aThis expressim waq substituted for tho oxpressian ciStatc. & . 
. Madras" by the Tamil Nzdu Adaptation of Laws Order, 1969, as. 
. -4 by the Tamil Nadu 44dlJgtatiun of ~ J W S  ( S w n d  Amnd. 
mntj Order, 1969, 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

6 .  

- .  . . - -A . - - .- --  - >-- 

1956 : T.N. Act XVI 1 presidency mall  cause 603 - - .  
Courts (Tamil Nadu At nendment) . 

Small Cause (7 IU ? t shall stav further p~ 8c e d i n g  on the ' 
application from the stage reached whcn the bond was 
accepted by thq Smdl C:use Court. , ,.. 

(2) The occupant shall, by the Gond aforesaid, .bind , 
'hiniself, with two sureties, for -oh sum as the Small -use 
Court thinks reasonable, having regard to the value of the . -f 

property and the probable costs of the suit to institute, 
, + -? 

within a month from the date of the acceptance +of the.bond . - , ;T 
i 

by the Small Cause Court, a s&t in the High Court or in. ,: ;: 
\ P  , + .  

the City Civil Court, ,as the . ~ s e  may be, to establish-his . 
' 

title to. .continue in possessicn of the prohffy: +, 

and in 'the event ,of such suJtvbeing dismissed, to ' pay* f&i 
applicait.the cost that may b&decreed to him in su&.$uit. . 

- . * +  - + 

* \  _ z , r ,  . . s 

(3) Where sudh suit is hot? idstituted within* k,j&kitth ,. 
- of the date of the acceptance 'of the security by thea Siadl: 
Cause Cou~t or where such suit having been instittiitid. " 
within the said period is dismissed, the Small Cause Court - 
shall proceed with the application from the stage reached 

1 , ;.-:;< y"* 
tc& 

., 6.1 \ ...+ *'% when security under sub-aectioi (1) was iaccepted.' % . -. 
+* =. j 8 

.*-?$ :% 
, ; . ' * , , .?,@ 

I C '  r >$.4 
', j?,: t i  ?. q\:cdm~8 

(4) decree passed in such suit against the . applicbnt . ~ $ 3  dzd% @ 
shaU'supersede the order, if any, made under sectiod 43. - - - 

(5) .Nothing ' contained . in . section I l22. shalli 
:suit$ under thigsection " . * ., ;. 

I - 

* ' 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

IVIADRAS, WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 20: 1995 

Pural tasl 4, Yu~ra, Th:ruvalluv lr Aa~!du-2026 

- -  -- - -____ 
. . --IID-, 

-* A ,  

/ Part IVLSection 2 
iA N.& A- a d  

2 

'k d- ..."..%" e n , ,  A d d -  J , \*. '  
L- -. 

The following Act of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly rec ived. the o\;ent 
of ths President on the 14th Feptember 1995 and is hereby publishecl for 
general information':- 

ACT No. 26 OF 1995. i 
An ~ c t  further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Ccurts Ant, ! 882 and t h ~  

Provincial Small Cause Courtr Act, 1887, in its applicafion to the State 
of Tomil Nadic. 

BE i t .  enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tan~il  Nadu in the 
Forty-sixth Year of the Republic of Jndiaas follows:- I 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Presidency Small Cause Courts and the Short title, 
Provincial Small Cause Courts (Tarnil Nadu Amendmtrit) Act, 1995. extent and 

oommence- 
a e n t  , 

(2) It extends to  the wholeof the State of Tamil Nadu. I#; 

(3) It shall comeinto force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notification, appoint. 

2. 111 the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882,- Amendment 
of Central Act 
XV of 1802. 

(1) in section 14, for the words "twenty rupees", the words "twa burrotred 
rupees " shall be substituted ; 

(2) in section 18,- 
(a) in the opening portion, foi the words " two thousand rupees", the words 

"twenty thousandr~p,ees" shall be substituted; 

(b)' id the Explanation 1, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words 
"twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

. .--,....- *,.* * -4 

G~OUQ] . . .  ... ?,!Vw2, ,., Ex,, (456) - 1 , . . , . (  95 ) . I f  I ' ! L 7 r 

I ,  

, . . I .  - . 1' . - - . -  4 r 

LatestLaws.com



LatestLaws.com

, \ 

TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY' 
. --- . , _,- ----. _- -- ---_- 

(3) ic sect~on 20, in the first paragraph, for tbe words "two thousand rupees" 
occurrhp in two places, the wordsc 'twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(4) in section 21, for the words ''013e thousand rupees", the words "ten tl-0x1- 
sand cupees" shall be substituted ; 

(5) in section 22,- 
mn 

(i) for che words "one thousand rupees", r the words " ten thousand 
rupee!: ' shall be substituted ; 

'I- (ii) for the words "three hundred rupees", tt-e words "three thousand 
rupees!" shall be substituted ; 

f.6) In section 39, in sub-section (I ) ,  for the words "one tllousand rupees", 
:he wrords "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(7) in section 41, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "five 
thausand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(8) in section 45, in the second paragraph, for th.e words "ten rupees", the 
words "one hundrcd rupees" shall he substituted ; 

t9) in section 63, in the first paragraph, for the words "one thousand 
npe&"' the words "two thousand and five hundred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

. (10) in section 69, in sub-sectio11 (I), for the words "five hundred rupees", 
the words <'two thousand and five hulldred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(11) in section 76, for the words "twenty rupees", the words "two hundrd 
rupees" shall be substituted. 

imendment ef 3. In the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887,- Central Ac 
Central Act q o f  I a 
LA of 1887. 

(1) in section 12, in sub-section (3), for the words ''twenty rupees", the 
W I B ~ S  "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(2) in section 15,- 

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words '' five hundred rupees ", the-words 
''6~6, thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-section (3). f o r  the words cGc ,~~c  rhousand rupecs", thc wo1.d~ "five 
thousard rupees" shall be subs:ituted ; 

1 ,  \ 

(3) in section 28, in sub-section (T), for the words "five thousand rupees", 
the tqords '<thirty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

?ransitory 4. (1) All suits a ~d proceedings of which the amount or value of the subject- 
provision. matter exceeds rupee two thousand but does not exceed rupees twenty thousand 

a d   ending in the adras City Civil Court, immediately before the date of the 
Commencement of t d is Act, shall be heard and disposed of by the Madras City Civil 
Con'", as if this A t had not becn passed. 4 

(2) All suits and proceedings of which the amount or value ofthe subject- 
glatfd!~ exceeds five hundred rupees but does not exceed five thousand rupees and 
penB:ng in any court of the District Munsif, immediately beforo the date of 
the cammencement of this Act, shall be heard and disposed of by such court of 
the J3istrici Munsif .is if this Act had not been passed. 

(By order of the Governor.) 

M. MUNIRAMAN. 
Secretary lo Government, Eaw Bcpartmzenf. 

v"-*r*rm"lv ---I. 11 C .  -,'P I-7ir..---warn* --.-y"ru---~ 4.- 

1- 

rumm AND WBCISIIED BY n l E  BIRICTQR QF STATIONaBY AND PLIM#NG,*~,&AS'' ' 

'd- aN )&HALLf 8 8  THE GQVEUHNeM OD ' t w L  ;YAPU - - .---+,a - 
- . -.. - -  - -  -- + .  

LatestLaws.com


	1927TN3.pdf
	1927TN3.pdf
	1955TN12.pdf
	1956TN16.pdf

	1995TN26.pdf

