R Latest
GLaws.

Helping Good People

COIm

Do Good Things

Bare Acts & Rules

Free Downloadable Formats

Hello Good People !




" Exira No. 23 ' REGISTERED NO. G/GNRy2.

chc 6ujarat 6ohtmmem 6asette
ey EXTRAORDINARY

PU BL!SHBD BY AUTHORITY

~ Vol. XXXI} THURSDAY NOV. 8, lBQO;KARTIKA 17, 1912

Seplntepaginghgiven to this Part in ordar that ¥ may be Sled '
R Separate Compilation.
PART- IV

Acts of lhe Guijarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regulations made by the Governor.

L

The following Act of the Gujarat Leglslature having been a.ssent-ed to by
the President on the 26th. October, 1990 is hereby pubhshed for general infor-
mation.

R M. MEHTA,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,

Lagal Department,.
GUJARAT ACT NO 19 OF 1990.

{First published, after having received the assent of the President in the
" “Gujarat. Government Gazette” on the 8th November, 1990).

" AN ACT

Surther to amend the Indian Boilers Aet, 1823 in sts application io the Stats
of Rujaral,

It is hereby enacted in the Forty- first  Year of the Repubhc of India as

follows :(—

1. This Act may be ca.]led the Indlan Boilers (Gu]arat"Amendme.Jt) .
« Act, 1990. &hort title.

V of 2, In the Indlai] Boilers  Ast, 1923 in its a.ppllcatlon to the State of
198, (ujarat ('harelnai’ber roferred to as “the principal Act”), in section 23, for Amendment
the words ‘“one hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall 22 of V of
be substltuted 231 o ¢ 1028,

IV=Extea-23-1



_fE

]

L
.53
-8

S
EEE

EEE

-

EE

2
£
-

289 GUJ. GOV, GAZ, EX., 8-11-1990 [PART IV
3. In tho principal Act, in section 23,—

F
(1) for the words “five hundred. rupees , the words “one -thousand
rupees” ghall be substituted ; -

~(2) for the words “one. hundred rupees , the words “two  hundred
rupees” shall be substituted. ' :

4, In the principal - Acb, in section 24, for the words “flve hundred
rupees”, the words “one ﬁhouaand rupees” ghall be substituted.

§. In the principal Act, in section 25, in sub-seotion (1), for the words
“five hundred rupeos”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

6. In the prineipal Act, in section 30,— -

(1) for. tho words “one hundred rupees”, the words “two - hundred
rnpoes” shall be gubstituted ; y :

(2) for the words “one thousand rupaes ', the words “two thousand
mpoes” shall be substituted.

+

-

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.



