R Latest
GLaws.

Helping Good People

COIMm

Do Good Things

Bare Acts & Rules

Free Downloadable Formats

Hello Good People !




Extra No. 5 REGISTERED No. G-44

The Gujarat Government Basette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. X ] WEDNESDAY, APRIL 9, 1969/CAITRA 19, 1891

Separaie paging Is gziven to this part In order that it may be
fied ms a separate compillation

PART 1V

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regolations made by the Governor, :

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
President on the 2nd April 1969 is hereby published for general information,

SUMANT M. VIDYARTHI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legal Department.
GUJARAT ACT NO. 5 OF 1969.

{First published, after having received the assent of the President in the “Gujarat
Government Gazefte” on the 9th April 1969.)

AN ACT

further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its appllcatmn
to the State of Gujarat.

It is hercby enacted in the Nineteenth Year of the Republic of India .'as

;

follows: —
1. (1) This Act may be called the Presndency Small Cause Courts (Gujaral Short title
Amendment) Act, 1968. c+ and

oemmense-
(2) .1t shall come into force on such date as the Statc Govemmcnt may, by ment.
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint. )

2. In section 18 of the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 (hcremaftcr Amendment

fg';;’f referred to as “the prmmpal Act”) for the words “two thousand rupses” wheteverof section
they occur, the words “threc thousand rupees™ shall be substituted: = ' 3,°F Act
2% 1882,

IV-Extra-7 {LinoY



26 GUJ. GOVT. GAZ, EX., APRIL 9, 1969/CATTRA 1D, 1891 {ParT IV

Amendment 3, Inp section 20 of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”

gg g:;t;oc% wherever they occur, the words “three thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

XV of 1882,

Amendment 4. In section 22 of the principal Act, in clause (b), for the words “two

ggseic_:tixm; thousand rupees” the words “three thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
a1 A

XV of 1882,

Amendment 5. In scction 41 of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”

of section | the words “three thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
of Aet XV

of 1882,

Amendment 6, In the Third Schedule to the principal Act, for Part E, the following shall

of Third . e
Sohodulo to D€ substituted, namely:

Aot XV
1882,

({E
(See section 66)
In the Small Cause Court for

SCALE OF FEES TO BE LEVIED IN DISTRAINTS FOR HOUSE RENT

Sums sued for Affidavit  Order to Commission  Total
and warrant sell
to
distrain

Rs, Rs, Rs. paise Rs, paise Rs. paise Rs. paise

1 and under b 0.25 0.50 0.50 1.25
B » 10 0.50 0.50 1.00 2.00
10 » 15 0.50 0.50 1.50 2.50
15 ” 20 0.50 1.00 2.00 3.50
20 ' 25 0.75 1.00 2.50 4.25
26 " 30 1.00 1.00 3.00 5.00
30 » 35 1.00 1.00 3.60 5.50
36 o 40 1.00 1.50 4.00 6.50
40 ” 45 1.25 2.00 4.50 7.75
45 " 50 1.50 C 2,00 5.00 8.50
50 " 60 2.00 2.00 6.00 10.00
80 " - 80 2.50 2.50 6.50 11.50
80 » 100 3.00 3.00 7.00 13.00
Upwards of 100 3.00 3.00 7 per centum




Part 1V] GUJ. GOVT. GAZ, EX., APRIL 0, 1969/CATERA 19, 1891 27

The above scale includes all expenses, except in suits where the tenant disputes
-the landlord’s claim, and witnesses have to be sub-poenaed, in which case each
-sub-poena for sums under Rs. 40 must be paid for at twenty five paise cach, and
scventy five paise above that amount; and also where peons are kept in charge of
.property distrained, such fee not exceeding seventy five paise per day as may be
fixed by the Registrar of the Small Cause Court must be paid per man.”.

7. For the Fourth Schedule to the principal Act, the following shall be sub- Substitution

. . of Fourth
stituted, namely: — Schedule by

& new onse

. ) in Act XV
THE FOURTH SCHEDULE of 1862,

(See section 72)

FEES FOR SUMMONSES AND OTHER PROCESSES.

When the amount or But does not Fee for Fee for other
value of the subject exceed BUMMOonses processes
matter exceeds

Rs. Rs, Rs. paise Rs. paise
0 10 0.15 0.15
10 20 0.25 0.25
20 50 0.50 0.50
50 100 1.00 1.00
100 200 1.25 2.00
200 300 1.50 | 3.00
300 400 1.75 4.00
400 500 2.00 5.00
500 600 2.25 6.00
600 700 2.50 7.00
700 800 2.75 8.00
800 900 3.00 9.00
900 1,000 3.25 10.00
1,000 1,100 3.40 10.50
1,100 1,200 3.50 11.00
1,200 1,300 3.65 11.50
1,300 1,400 3.75 12.00
1,400 1,500 3.90 12.50
1,500 1,600 4.00 13.00
1,600 1,700 4.15 13.50
1,700 1,800 4.25 14 .00
1,800 1,900 4.40 14.50
1,900 2,000 4.50 15.00
2,000 2,100 4.65 15.50
2,100 2,200 4.75 16.00
2,200 2,300 4.90 16.50



28 GUJ. GOVT. GAZ, EX., APRIL %, 1969/CAITRA 19, 1801 [Pagr IV

When the amount or But does not Fee for Fee for other
value of the subject exceed suImmonses processes
matter exceeds

Rs. Rs, Rs. paise Rs. paise
2,300 2,400 5.00 17.00
2,400 2,500 6.1 17.50
2,500 2,600 5.25 18.00
2,600 2,700 5.40 18.50
2,700 2,800 5.50 19.00
2,800 2,900 5.65 19.50
2,00 3,000 5.15 20.00"

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT {ENTRAL PRESS, AHMEDABAD, -



Exira No. 34 ' : REGISTERED No. G-448

aaa

The Sujarat Gobernment Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XIV] WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 28, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 7, 1895

Separate paging is given to this Pari in order that if may
be filed as a separate compilation,

PART IV

Acts of the Gujarai Legislatare and Ordinance promulgated and
Regulations made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by
the Governor on the 27th November 1973 is hereby published for general
information.,

S. 8. SHAH,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legal Department,

GUJARAT ACT NO. 28 OF 1973

( First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the
Gujarat Government Gazette on the 28th November 1973 ).

An Act further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act,
1882 in its application to the City of Ahmedabad.

Tt iz herchy cnacted in the Twenty-Fourlh Yoear of the Repullic of Indja as
follows:--

1. This Act may be oalled the Presidency Small Causs Courts (Gujarat Sbort title.
Amcendment) Act, 1973, .

2. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 in its application to Amendment
{he City of Ahmcdabad (hereinafter rcferred to a8 “the principal Act’), section :gm"fg
7 ghall be renunibered ag sub-section (I} of that section and after sub-section 182, @
XV of (1) a3 so renumbsred, the following sub-sections and Explanation shall be
1882 gdded, namely =
205
1y —Extra—80



290 GUJ, GOVI-GAZ, BX, NOVEMBER 25, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 7, 1805 . [PasrIV

“(2) The Chief Judge of the Court of Small Causes of Ahmedabad shall

. be appointed by the State Government in consultation with the High Court

sither by promotion of a person in $he judicial service of the State Govern-

ment or by appointment from amongst persons eligible to be appointed as

such Judge in accordanco with the provisions of clause (2) of article 233
of the Constitution.

(3) The appointment of other Judges of the Court of Small Causes of
Ahmedabad shall be made either by the State Government from amongst
persons not in the judicial service of the State, in accordance with the
provigions of article 234 of tho Constitution, or by the High Cowmt by pro-
motion of a person in such service:

Provided that the appointments by the State Government and by
the High Court shall be made in such proportion as may be determined
by rules made by the State Government in consultation with the High
Court. :

Ezplanalion.— In  this scotion the expression “Judicial service of the Btate”
shall have the same meaning as given fo that expression in article 236 of the
Constitution.”.

Amendment 3, Tn sub-sections () and (2) of seotion 8A of the principal Act, for

gf-fxi%nvsff the words ““the State Government’’ the words ‘‘the State Government in

1832, consultation with the High Court” shall be substituted,

i’RINTEL'; AT THB GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.



Extra No. 17 | REGISTERED NO. G/GNR/:

A

GIlp: Guijarat Gouernment @agntte
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

VOLXLII] WEDNESDAY. JUNE 5, 2002 /TYAISTHA 15,1924 r

Separate pagmg is given to this Part in order that it
’ may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART- 1V
Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated
and Regulations made by the Governer.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented

to by the President on the 24th May, 2002 is hereby published for general
information.

V.M. KOTHARE,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Pariiamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACTNO. 17 OF 2002.

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in
the “Gujarat Government Gazette”, on the 5th June, 2002).

AN ACT

further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, {882 in its application

to the City of Ahmedabad, for the purposes hereafter appearing.

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-third Year of the Republic of India as

follows .- _
1. (1) This Act may be called the. Presndency Small Cause Cotirts  ghort title
{Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2002. and

commence-
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government ment,

may, by notification in the Official Gazette. appoint.

‘\ 2. Inthe Presidency Small Cause Courts Act. 1882, in its application Amend-
XA of N : had ; “ti . - ment of
1882. ta the City of Ahmedabad (hereinafter referred to as “the pnnc:pz}l Act'hn section 18

sechon 18, for the words “five thousand rupees™ wherever they occur. the of XV of
_ words “twe lacs rupees” shall be substituted. _ 1582,

[V EX. 17-i 17-1



172

Amend-
ment of
section 20
of XVof
1882,

Amend-
ment of
section 22
of XV of
i882.

Amend-
ment of
section 41
of XV of
1882.

Substita-
tion of
section 71
of XVof .

1882.
Court fees.

Substitu-
tien of
section 72
of XV of
1882.

Process
fees.

Trausfer of
pending
cases.

. R

GUIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX.562002 ~  [PART IV

3. In the principal Act, in section 20, for the. words “five thousand rupees”
wherever they occur. the words “two lacs rupees’ shall be substituted.

4. In the principal Act, in section 22, in clause (b), for the words “five
thousand rupees" the words “two lacs rupees™ shali be substituted.

5. In the principal Act, in section 41, for the words “five thousand
rupees”. the words “two Jacs rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In the principal Act, for section 71, the following section shall be
substituted, namely : -

“71. The Court fees leviable in suits, appeals and applications under
this Act shall be the same as are leviable under Chapter I of the Bombay
Couri-fees Act, 1959 and the provisions of that Act shall, mutatis mudandis,
apply to the recovery of such court-fees.”.

7. Inthe principal Act, for section 72, the fotlowing section shall be
substituted, namely:-

“72. Save as otherwise provided by or under any provision of this Act,
the fees chargeable for serving and executing any processes issued by the
Small Cause Court, Aimedabad shall be the same as are prescribed by the
High Court of Gujarat under section 32 of the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959.”.

8. Ali suits and applications of a civil nature wherein the subject matter
exceeds in amount or value five thousand rupees but does not exceed two
lacs rupees pending in the Courts of City Civil, Ahmedabad immediately
before the commenceruent of the Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gujarat
Amendment) Act, 2002 shall after such commencement, stand transferred
to, and be disposed of by the Judge, Court of Small Cauqe Ahmedabad
within the local limit of his ordinary jurisdiction.

;._-_—-—-—

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR

Bom.
XXXVI
of 1959,

BonXXXVI
of 1959,

Guj. 17
of 20412,



	1969GUJARAT5.pdf
	Guj-1968-The Presidency Small Cause Court (Gujarat Amendment) Act-5.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-28.pdf
	Guj-2002-The Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-17.pdf


