
 

 

 

 

Bare Acts & Rules 

Free Downloadable Formats 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Hello Good People ! 

LaLas 



Extra No. 5 REGISTERED No. G44# 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY - 

Vol. S ] R7EDNESDAY, APRIL 9, 1069/CAITRA 19, 1891 

Stvh pi*  Ir drm ta tib pm In order that ti rrf k 

P A R T  IV 
Acts of the Gnjarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and 

Regulations made by the Governor. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the 

President on the 2nd April 1969 is hereby published for geileral information. 

SUMANT M. VIDYARTHI, 
Secretary to the Governnlcnt of Gujarat, 

Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 5 OF 1969. 

(First published, after having received (he assent of t he  President in the "G~ljnrot  

Governrtient G(izerieH on the 9th April 1969.) 

AN ACT 
1 

further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, irl its application - - 

to the State of Gujarat. 

It is hereby enacted in the Nineteenth Year of the Republic of India as 
follows : - 

1. ( I )  This Act may be called the Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gufatat Short titlo 

Amendment) Act, 1968. and 
oommcnec. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may. ,by me~lt .  

notification in the Oficial Gazette, appoint. 

2. Tn section 18 of the presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 (hereinafterAmendmBnt 
F:,D' referred to as "the principal Act") for the words "two thuusand rupees", wheteieror section 

they occur, the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted. i 18 of A C ~  

XV of 
1882. 

25 
W-Extra-7 (Unb)  



Amondlucnt, 3. In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words " t~vo thousand rupees" 
of wetiou wherever they occur, the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 
20 of Act 
XV of 1882. 

Amendllle~~t 4. In  section 22 of the principal Act, in clause (b),  for the words "two 
of 8octiul1 thousand rupees" the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 
22 of Act 
XV of 1882. 

hendlncnt.  5. In scction 41 of the principal Act, for the words "two thousand rupees" 
of aeftiu11& the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 
of Act 
of 1882. 

A r n ~ n d i l ~ r ~ l t  6. I n  the Third Schedule to the principal Act, for Part E, the following shall 
of Third be substituted, namely : - 
Schcdulc to 

(See section 66) 

In the Small Cause Court for 

SCALE OF FEES TO BE LEVIED IN DISTRAINTS FOR HOUSE RENT 

Sums sued for Affidavit Order to Comnlission Total 
and warrant sell 

ta 
distrain 

1 and under 
6 1 s  

10 1P 

15 P I  

20 *1  

25 I* 

30 I? 

35 I1 

40 *I  

45 I* 

50 *I 

60 I? 

80 Y ?  

Upwards of 

Rs. Rs. paise Rs. paise Rs. paise Rs. paise 

0.50 1.25 
1.00 2.00 
1.60 2.50 
2.00 3.60 
2.50 4.25 
3.00 5.00 
3.60 5.50 
4.00 6 .50  
9 - 5 0  7.76 
5.00 8.60 
6.00 10.00 
6.50 11.60 
7.00 13.00 
7 per centum 



PART IV] GUJ. GUW. GIX. ,  EX., APRIL 0, l'JG9jCrlT'I'RA 10, 1891 27 

T h e  above scale includes all expelises, except it1 suits where the tenant disputes 

-the landlord's claim, and witnesses have to be sub-poenaed, in which case each 
sub-poena for sums under Rs. 40 must be paid for at twenty five paise each, and 

seventy five paise above that amount; and also where peons are kept in charge of 
,property distrained, such fee not excceding seve~lty five paise per day as may be 

fixed by the Registrar of the Small Cause Court must bc paid per man.". 

7. For the Fourth Schcdule to the principal Act, the follvwit~g shall be sub- Substitntion 
of Fourth 

stituted, namely : - Scl~eduls by 
a new one 

"THE FOURTH SCHEDULE 
in  Act XV 
of 13Y2. 

(Sec section 72) 

FEES FOR SUMMONSES AND OTHER PROCESSES. 

When the  mount or Rut, docs not. Fee for FCC for other 
d u e  of the subject cxcccd ~llrnrnonses processes 

matter vxcecds 

Rs. Rs. Rs, paist! Rs. paise 



2s GUJ. GOVT. GAZ., EX., APRJL 0, lOBD/CAITRA 19, 1801 [PART IV 

When tlie amolirlt or But does not Pee for Fec for other 
value of t,lir, subject exceed sarnmonses processes 

matter cxceedv 

Rs. Rs. Rs. paise Rs. paise 

PRIWIED AT THE GOVERNMENT .TTCENIRhL PRESS, AHhlEDABhD. 



bEkBlEk&D No. E449 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLBHED PY AUTHORITY 

- - 

Val. XIV ] JVELINESDAY, NOVEMBER 28, 1973lAGRAHAYANA 7, 1895 

-- 

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may 

be filed as a separate compilation. 

PAPT IV 
Acta of the Gujarat Legislatare and O r h c e  promulgated and 

Regulations made by the Governor. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assentod to by 
the Governor on the 27th November 1973 is hereby published for general 

illformation. 
S. S. SHAH, 

Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 
Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 28 OF 1973 

(First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the 

G~tjflrat Govertlmenr Grrzelfe on the 28th November 1973). 

h Act further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 

1882 in its application to the City of Ahmedabad. 

11 i~ hereby enacted in the Twenty-3'o~rbh Year of !he R~puLlic of India as 

follows :-: 

1, This ~ c t  may bo oalled the Preldonoy Smell Gauss Court8 (Qujarat ~ d &  
hcndment)  Aat, 1973. 

2. In the Presidsnoy Small Cause hurts Act, 1882 in its applicat,ion to b m h t  

I he City of Ahmcd~bad (hrr~inraft~r rt ferrtd l o  as "the principal Act9'), seotian of umtion 7 
of Aot Xv o. 

7 shall be rcnu~ihered AB sub-section (1) of that section and after sub-section 1 ~ 2 ,  

4 (1) 89  so renui~ib~red, the f o l l o ~ n g  sub-sectjona and Explanation shall be 
added, nnrnoly :- 

a98 

1v-~xtra-80 



"(2) The Chief Judge of the Court of b a l l  Causos of Ahmedabad shall 
be appointed by tho Stato Government in consultation with the High Gotirt 
either by promotion of a person in the judicial service of the State &vem- 
ment or by appointment from amongst porsons eIigibIt! to be appointed as 

such Judge in accordance with the provisions of clause (2) of artido 233 
of the Constitution. 

(2) The appointment of other Judges of tho (hurt of Small Causca of 
Ahmodabad shall be made either hy thc state Government from amonget 
persons not in the judicial service of the State, in accordance with the 
provisions of arbicle 234 of tho Constitution, or by thc High Gult by pro- 
motion of n pcrson in such service: 

Provided that tth,  appointment,^ by thc Stato avernrnent and by 
thc High Court shall bc made in such proportion as may bt! doferlnined 
by rules rnado by tho State Government in conaultafion with the High 
court. 

E~pEun~ion.- In thifi scction thc expression "Judicial servicc of thc State" 
shall b v n  the Rsnle meaning as given to that. expremion in artjclo 236 of the 
Constitution.". 

hmdment  3. In su1,-sections ( I )  and (2) of motion 8A of the principal Act, for 
of motion 8.4 
ofactJVof the words "thc State Govcrnnler~t" the words "tho State Government in 
1882. consultation with the High h u r t  " &all bc substilutcd. 



Extra No, 17 REGXSTIEWD NO. GIGNW;. 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

- . . . - . -. . . .- - 

VOL XLlII] WEDNESDAY. JUNE 5 ,  2002 ~IYAISTHA 1 5.1 924 , 

- 
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it 

may bber filed as a Separate Compilahrr. 

PART-  XV 
Acts of the ~ijjarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated 

and Regulations made by the Goventor. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented 
to by the President on the 24th May, 2002 is hereby published for general 
information. 

V. M. KOTHARE;, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 17 OF 2002. 

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in 
the "Gujarat Government Gazette", on the 5th June, 2002). 

AN ACT 

f ~ t i t h e ~ .  to  amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 in its application 

10 thc City of Ahmedabad, for the purposes hel-eahei- appearing. 

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-thi~d Year of the Republic of hdia a\ 

follow5 ;- 

1. I I )  This ACE may be called the Presidency Small Cause Couns 

(Gui~~-;lt Amendment) Act, 2002. 

(2)  It shall come into force on such date as the State Government 

ma!:, bv notification in the Qficinl Gnzette, appoint. 

K!' of 1. InthePresidencySmalfCauseCourtsAct. 1882.initsapplication 
1881. ro the City of Ahmedabad (hereinafter referred to as "the principal .4ctm). in 

s x l l c l t l  1 8.  for the words "five thousand rupees" wher4eves they occur. the 

- t ~ ~ l l - t l  ..I\SG lacs ~~upees" shall be substituted. 

Short tide 

and 

commence- 

ment 

Amend. 

n~ent of 

section 18 

of XV of 
111s2. 

I V EX. 17-1 17-1 



. '-. - .  . .'. 

1 7 -  7' GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 5-6-2002 BART 1v . . 

. b e n d -  3. In the principal Act, in section 20, for the words "five thuusilnd rupeeh" 
mentaf wherever they occur. the words "two lacs rupees" shall be substituted. 
section W 

of xv of 

1882. 

~ m e m t  4, In the principal Act, in section 22, in clause (b), for the words "five 

thousand mpees", the words "two lacs rupees" shall be substituted. 
section 22 

 mend- 5. In the principal Act, in section 41, for the words "five thousand 
anent of rupees". the words "two lacs rupees" shall be substituted. 
section 41 

of XV of 
18112. 

Substiai- 6. In the principal Act, for section 71, the following section shall be 
tion of substituted, namely : - 
section 71 

of XV of 
1882. 
court fees. "71. The Court fees leviable in suits, a p p d s  and applications under. 

this Act shall be the same as are leviable under Chapter 111 of the Bombay 

Cou1.t-fees Act, 1 959 and the provisions of that Act shall, mufutis mudadis, Born. 

apply to the recovery of such court-fees.". XXXVI 

of 1959. 

Substitu- 

tion of 

section 72 

of XV of 
1882. 

Process 

fees. 

7. In the principal Act, for section 72, thp, following section shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

"72. Save as otherwise provided by or under any pmvision of this Act, 

the fees chargeable for serving and executing any processes issued by the 

Small Cause Court, Ahmedabad shall be the same as are p~xscribed by the 

High Court of Gujarat under section 32 of the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959.". 
of 1959. 

Transfer of 8. Ali suits and applications of a civil nature wherein the subject matter 

pending exceeds in amount or valire five thousand rupees but does not exceed two 

cases. lacs rupees pending in the Courts of City Civil, Ahmedabad immediately 

before the commencement of the Presidency Small Cause Couris (Gujarar cnj, 1 7  

Amendment) Act, 2002 shall after such commencement, stand transferred of 2001. 

to. and be disposed of by the Judge, Court of Small Cause, Ahmedabad 

with~n the local limit of his ordinary jurisdiction. 


	1969GUJARAT5.pdf
	Guj-1968-The Presidency Small Cause Court (Gujarat Amendment) Act-5.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-28.pdf
	Guj-2002-The Presidency Small Cause Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-17.pdf


