
 

 

 

 

Bare Acts & Rules 

Free Downloadable Formats 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Hello Good People ! 

LaLas 



C(iSTFsST; 
-*La--.--.-- -- ha---.- A,.--. ---.-A*--,---~-.~ -----.--.*,---.*- 

GUJW'$%AT ACT 89. WLTII OF 1983., - 911 A:.! t-; arnes,d +lie Bombay L:,tnar Wt?lfSrp 
Plln& Act. 1364. fo: s.z;*.:id;r:g 11 i.1 ,ir:;i 5:il:~i;~e i t  iriii? f r ~ : ~ ?  iir, rhc $he ~ ; ~ l ~  
2% G:ljarfi; tois cel:;ja ;'&.?r ;;q,nscc. 

__I__-_ ,-w-".*-w.<.-%*w * = - V " - * a r w  _.--%%.*%*.*"*--*- .*----- e w w m v *  _ __*---*-- "_ ,-=-- __ ** 
- i s  1 l y,)]j:i\z<"i;)L- \ : A !  a ) ;  t ; $ 3 >  (~:.:.:?,:; "[ ).. , i , [ ; ) ; ; l l .& L>,, 

a ,: J l i .  3 : a ( > # . ! )  ; : < . 4 h ; ; l 1 . ( j  ! . ,  :).,- 
f:](, ~ * r < " < i ( : ~ ~ ! l :  ) t i  i.;;*s :;!;I :;, ,-' 4~{l i l , .cbo 1 : ) # : I ,  i \  . / ) ( ~ ! ( ~ I Y \ .  r~3[ l j j j i* j  & ) (  * ; ~ . I , $  . .:; 

, - * x r. ' 
;~>:(>rl.il~::i{>r! I--.. 







~ m e r ~ i ~ a n ~  9. &lfIc;r ,;epii(,8;l 4; t n f  I?::: ~ ~ l ~ q p ~ l ~ ~ : ~ , ' j  - lf . , j -?  t.jItp f t j ] ! t ~ ~ x ; i n . o  nr-y sp&i4>ll &ajl 
c 

~f..r)ti~ll inScr.tf.;j, 3rarnr]y : -.- 
GiA in Born, 
XL of 1963, 

[a) t&slzd OPI the notice Ibciard: or ii? i t s  a3I,senco on a conspiousus 
part sf the ~~ri.nlisc~s, - ef eai:li r:,t.;k7siishani~rit in trhiob the ianp&il, ~ G G U ~ U -  

Iaeliins ~ ~ ' i ' l ' i *  cnri~cci. 

(6) p~.~l>\f.;h.,od Oi?<iuE Gcjzfhf?, a;ac$ 







-- - 
Vol. IvI TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 5, 19631 MAGHA 16, 1884 

Separate paging is giren to thh Part in order that if 'mag. be 

fl Itd ap a separate compilation 
IC- 

PART IV 
Acts of the Oujarat LegisIature and Ordinances promulgated 

and Regulations made by the Governor. 

CONTENTS 

PAoES 
GUJARAT ACT HO. YnI OF 1863.-An Act to amend the Bombay Labour Welfaro 

Fund Act, 1963 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 21-22 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented to by the 
President on the 1st February 1963, is hereby published for general 
information. ' 

. M. G. MONANI, 
Secretary to theaGovernment of Gujarat, 

I Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. vnr OF 1963. 

(First published, d t e r  having received the 'assent of the President in the 

" Gujarat Governmetti Gnzetle" on the 5th February 1963). 

An Act to amend the Bombay Labour Welfare Funds Act. 1953. 

It ia hereby enacted in the Thirteenth Year of the Republicof Indis as follows:- 

1. This Act may be called the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Ifu jarat Amend- mart bitls. 
ment) Aot, 1962. 

wm, 8. In section 6A of th$~ Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Aot, 1983, after a ~ b -  h e n b e n b  
of seotion BA XL section (12), the following sub-section shrill be inserted and shall be deemedof  born,^^ 

of 1w3, always to have been ineerted, namely:- of 1968. 

81 
IV-E*trM W h )  ! 



5 1 

"(13) Nothing in the forego& 'siona of this aection shall apply ta 
unpaid nccumulations not alreadypi nr the Board, 44 

(a) in reapect of which no Bepz@~h accounta have been maintained 80 

that the unpaid claim8 of empl~yeeshre not traceable, or 

( b )  which are proved to have been *pent before tbe sixth day of December 
1961 * fl r 

and acoordingly such unpaid accumulations shall not be 'liable to be collected 
and paid under aub-section (4) of section 3." 

t 



$xira No. 35 REGISTERED No, G-448 

-= 
.-- . 

Vd. ZXV 1 YRIDAY, NOVEMBER 30, 1973/AGRMAYANA 0, 1895 

-, 

PiBT lV 
Acts el Gsjuaf -labre and Ordmnncm ptommlpbd 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the 

President on the 22nd November, 1973 is hereby published for general information. 

S. S. SHAH, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 29 OF 1973. 

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in the "Glr$rat 

Government Gazette" w the 30th November, 1973). 

b An Act fuxthcr to ~mcnd Ghc Bombay Labour Jlrelf~rc Fund Act, 1963. 

It iir herdl  enadd in the Twenty-fourth Year of tha Rcpublio of Tndia as 
f o l l 0 ~ : -  

- 
I. ( I )  %is A& may be d l e d  the Bombay bbour Wevare h d  (&jarat Short titlc 

Amendment) Act, 1973. 
and Corn- 
menmm~nt. 

(2) Tt ahall coma into form on moh date ae the Stsb Cfovernm~nt may, 
by notification in the OfJiciul C a m ,  appoint. 

0 -  8. In w&ion 2 of the Elombay hbour Welfare Pund A&, 1963 (herein- ~,,drnaor 

a h r  referred t o  as '<the principal ~ot''),- o f  sootion 
of Born, X 

1"s. (1) after clame ( I ) ,  the following dausr. fihr.11 be insartad, namely:- of 1953. 

"(1.4) *'oontribukion" meam the aum of monoy payable as mntribution 
b +he Board in amordance with the pm\<&one of setion 6B;"; 

207 
m-IMm-61 



288 QUJ. GOVT. GcSZ., EX., NOVEMBER 30, 1973/AGRAH:\TAXd 9, 1895 [PART 

(i) for the words ''manual or clerical" tha worh ('utanusl, cbrid, 
supamisory or technical "shall be subatituted; 

(i+] the following shall be added at the end, namely:- 

"but daea not include any pereon- 

(a) who i8,employed mainly in s managerial capacity, or 

(b) who, being employed in 8 eupervisory capacity, drama wagea exoee- 
ding seven hundred and fifty nlpceR per rnensem or exeroim, either 
by the nnturo of the duties attached to the office or by reason of the 
powera vested in b i t ,  functions mainly of a managerial nature;"; 

(3) in chum (d), for the portion begiming with t.be bracket&, fiemaand words 
"(iigany esfablishmont" and ending with the words "or any State Government" 
the following shall ba aubatitutcd, namely:- 

I'(id5) any c&bl ihent  mithin tho mealling of the Bombay Shops and B,,. 
Establishments Act, 1948, which rmploys, or on any working day during the LXB. 
twehe months preceding tho specified date employed, ten or mom persons: f51f 

Provided that, nny such establi~hment 8hd1, subject to the prr~viuion contained 
in $he succeeding proviso continuc to  bt: au 1~1catnbI;shment for the purposes of 
thie Act, notmithatanding a reduction in tile numbcr of persons to less than ten 
at any eubsequent time: 

Provided W h c r  that, mhoro for is contjnnous pcrind of not less than thrce 
months thc number of persona ctuployed tl~crcin has been less than Ecn, such 
estabIiahtnent sltnll wnsc to be an cstablishruent for the purposos of thia Act 
with effect from the bcginuing of t h ~  month following tthc expiry of the anid 
period of three luonthtr, and tht: nn~ployer shall, within one month from tho date 
of such cessation, intjmmh by mgistertd post tho fact thereof t o  such authority 
as the State Government m3p apeoify in this behnlf;" ; 

(4) aftor olause (91, the following olnuac ehall be insertxd, mmc1y:- I 

"($A) "specified dab'' in relation to any establishment for the purpm 
of payment to the Bonrd of any suzll apecjficd in iten1 (a), (b) or (bb) of aub- 
motion (2) of section 3 shall be the date on or beforo which any such sum 
bocomca payable to  the Fund;"; 

(6) for olausa (If), the following shrill be subatituted, mmely :- I 
"(11) ''mge.~" meona mgea aa defined in clause (I$) of aection 2 of the Iv of 

Payment of Wagca Act, 1936;". 1986. 

imsndmBnt 3. In soction 3 of the principal A&,- 
lf d o n  a 
,i Bom. XL 
c I@m. ( f )  in aub-section ( I ) ,  for the word, figuro and lethr "section 6A" the wor& 

figurea and lettern "wotiomns,6A anti,GB" shall be substitukl; 



PART IT] GUS, GOVT. GAZ., EX., NCIVZMBEEL 30, 1978/AQRAHAYANA 9. 1898 209 

(a) after ihm {b) ,  the following shall be inserted, namel~ :- 

"(bb) any oontribution paid under ~eotion 6B ;"; 

(b) in item (d) ,  the word '$and" shall be deleted; 
- 

(c)  after item (e), the following items shall ba added, n~mely :- 

"(f) any loan, grant-in-aid or eubsidy paid by the  State Govern- 
ment or any local authority or statutory corporation; 

(g) all suau rccaived in any other manner or from any othcr murce.". 

4. Mtcr section 6A of the principal Act, t,he following new aection &all be hrQI0n of new mation 
inserted, nanlcly :- 6B in Born. 

XL of 1068. 

"6B. ( I )  There shall be paid to the Board for t,he purposes of this Act ContribnMoa. 
a contribut.ion puyablc by thc e~ilployer in respect of an employee in an 
establishment, (hcrcinafter referred to  as "tho employer's contribution"), a 
contribution pzyable by such clnployee (hereinafter refcrred to as "the amployee'a 
mnt,ribution") and a contribution payahle by the State Governnlent, as bere- 
innfter pro~iclcd and every such contribution shall form part of the Fund. 

(2) Tho amount of ewployee's contribution shall be payable evsry six months 
in respect of every employoc whose name &and8 on the register of the acatabli- 
ahment mnoorned on 30th June and 31st Decomber respectively, at the rate of 
25 paise for every such employea and the amount of employer's oontribution 
shall be payable every ~ i r  months at. the rate of 60 pai~e fot caoh such employee: 

Provided that the State Goverrlnicnt may, by notification in the Official &a, 
inorease the  aid rate of e~nploycc'a m~ltribution to such amount not exceeding 60 
paise if it oonsidera neccmry to do so t~ enable the Board to fulfil the objects of 
this Aot : 

Pmvidod further that whero the ratc of employse'n oontribution is so increaaed 
by thr: Stato Government, therate of employer's contribution shall be twice the 
rate of employee's oontribution as so inoreased. 

(3) Every employer ahall pay to the Board both the eiqloyer's contribution 
and the  employee'^ contribution boforo the 16th day of July and 16th day of 
January, every year. 

(4)  Notwit.h~t~nding anything contained in sub-sections (2) and (3), the 
employer's contribution and tmhe employee's contribnt-ion payable for the 
fird timn after the date of the coming into form of the Bombay Labour 

::h2' Wolfare Fil~id (GJujmnt Amnendmcnt) Act, 1973, (hereinafter rcfemd to as "the 
Ima, appointed date") shall be payablo before such date, and at  the respective 



800 GUS. GOVT. GAZ., EX., NOVEMBER 30, lW3/AC:RARAYL4NA 0, 1806 [PART TV 

rataa BS aforesaid for every employee whow name stanarr on the regjater 
of the astsblishment conoerned on such date as map be spwificct by the 
State Qovernment by notifioation in the Offim'd QuW and auch contribu- 
tions payable next thereafter shall be paid in accordance with the provisions 
of this Act, irrespective of whether the period of six months aa apscified in 
sub-section (2) has p a d  or not. 

(5) Notwithstandi~g anything oontaincd in any other enactment but subjeot 
to the provieions of this Act and the rdw mads thereunder the employer 
shall be ontitlad +.a recaver from snp such employee that ehphyw'fi contribution 
by doduction h m  hie wages, and not otherwise; and such dodnction shell be 
deemed to be x deduction authorised by or under the Payment of Wagen of 
Ant, 1936 : 1081. 

Provided that no such dduotion ~IlslI be made in excm of the amount of the 
mntribation psyobh by auoh employee, nor a h d  any 8nch deduction exuept kke 
deduction it1 respat of the crnployee'h oontributian p y a h b  for the firfit t i~ne 
after tho appoiuM doh bo made h r n  say wages other than the wages for thc 
months of June and Decelubcr : 

Providcd further that, if through inadvcctanoe or atherwise, no deduction har 
been d e  from the wagea of an employe8 for the months afornsaid, auch dodua- 
tion may be m d c  from the wages of mch employee for any subsequent month 
or month with thr. permission in writing of the I~mpeator ~ppointed nnder 
this Act. 

(6) NotwiLhqt.mJing any oontract to the  cclntrary no omploycr shall deduct 
the employer's onntrihution from any wages p*yrblt: to an smployoc or ot!;er- 
wise recover it from the omplopoe. 

(7) Any sum duly deducted by an mra&loyer from the wfigas of an employee 
under this aoction shall be daamcd t o  have beell entrusted to him by tho 
employee for the purgosa of paying the oontribntion in respect of  wl~ich it 
wae deduoted. 

(8) Au ornployer ahall pry the employ~r'a and the employee's contribution 
to the Board by cheque, money-order or in cash, and he ahaU bear the 
axpensas of ramittirag to the Board auoh contributi~n. 

(9) The Wallfate Commia8ioner shall aubmit t o  the State Government m soon 
as posqibla after the end of July and January every year in the prescribed form 
a statement showing the total amount of the employer's c~nt~riibution in respeot 
of his establishment for the pariod to whioh the statement relates and on reoeipt 
of the atatemant fiom the Wellsre Commimioner, tho State Government shall 
pa7 to the Board a a~nttihut~ion of an amount, equal t,o the ernployfir's contri- 
bution in respect of that establishment: 

Provided that the statement in relation t o  the employee's contribution payable 
for thc first time sftcr the appointed date referred to  in sub-scotion (d) shall bt! 
~nbmittod 8% soon a8 possible aftcr thr: ~pecifird date in rclat.ion ta that 
eontribntion.". 



P-IRT IYI  CLV. GOVT. GAZ,, BX., NOVEXEER 30, 1973/AClIAHhTANA 9, 1805 301 

5. In section 12 of the prinoipal A d ,  to  sub-nection (I), the following ahall be I m r b t  

added at  the and, namely:- ofBmn. of m d m  'II I0 
of 1969. 

Born 
"Ispeotor appointed, whether by a local nutLoritp or the atate Qovsrnmsnt 

r;rr- under the Bombay ,$hops and Eabbliehments Aot, 1948 in relation to any area, 
I X  af ahall be deomed to be a290 Tnapeotor for the purposes of thiR Act, in reapeat '- of sstablishmenta, to whioh thie Aot appliea and the lorlei lirnita within which 

ewh I[nspehr shall exemise his funations under thia Aot shall be the area for 
whioh he ia appointed under the a i d  Ad."'. 

8. In seotion 18 of the prinaipal ht, in sub-aaotion(l), for the worda ''in the -b 
presoribsd manuer" the words "in the manner specified in sub-mtion (1) of ef m o t h  18 

mtion 4 for conetitution of the Board" shall be aubtikuted. OiBOm. XL 
of 1863. 

PRINIBD AT 'FBB 00- PRESS, O A H D m  



Extra No 58 . REGISTEWD NO. GIGMU2 ' 

Cbo Bu jarat 6ob~mmtnt 6wje tte 

PUBlbJSHED BY AUTHORITY ---- 4. - 
TTol. XXI] FTCI DAY, D1$CX;\IBEPI 26, ~SSP;PAUSA 5, 1902 
+ -- - e C  - -.- -r<rurm c-- - --- 

Separate paging i s  given ta this Part in order that it may be Bled as a 
- 

separate Compilation. 
- - -------..-.-.- - 

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances prumnIgated and 
Regulations made by the Governor. 

The following Act of the Gujamt Legislature having been assented to by the 
President on the 20th December, 1980 is hereby published for general information. 

5. P. VASAVDA. 
Sojnt Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 36 OF 1980. 

(Rrst pul$sbed, after having received the assent of the President in the 
"Gujarm Government Gazette" on the 26th December, 1980). 

An Act further to amend the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953. I 

It i s  hereby enacted in the 'I'birty-first Year of the Republic of India as 
fo4m : - 

I. ( I )  This Act may be becalled the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujanrt sbrt t#b 

Amendment) Act, 1980. and 
P ommeam 

(Z) It shall come into force on such date as the St~tt~Gwermtnt  may. by 
mmt. 

notification in the DfjGcial Gazette. appoint. 

Born 2. h Bombay Labur Welfare Fund Act, 1953 (hereiodfter referred to rmendo.rc 
XL of piprindpal Ad"), in section 3, in sub-ssclion (2). tifter clause ibb), tba o f d i o n  8 
lOaa of Born, 8 1 

following clause shall be inserted, namely :- o f  lea-. 

"(bbb) any Jnttrest paid under section W,". I 4 
68-1 

IV-$dm 68-2 



58-2 ' GUJ. GOYT. GAZ., EX., DECE31UER 20, 19801PAUSA 6, 1002 [PART IV 

I 11 sertion 3. la the principal ALI, dl l r i  section GB, the following new section shall IB 
OF new \ 

,,,tion inserted, narni ly : - 
:jU i n  Born. 
S L  of  1953. 

I n  terost on 
unpaid , 

aoou mula- 
t ione, 
tines and 
oontribatlona 
after 
notice of 
<Lamand. 

"6C. (1) W11erc an c~nployer tlozs llot pay to the Board any amount of 
unpaid accumulaiions or h e s  realised from the employees or any amount oE the 
employer's or, as the case may k, employee's contributions within the time 

he is required by or u d e r  Ihe provisions of this Act to pay such amount, the 
Welfa~c Cbmmissiouer may causc to k scrved a llorice 011 such employer to 

pay to the Board the anlollnt within ttlc pied specifled tt~crcin, which shall 
ntji bc less than thirty days from !he date of service of such notice. 

(2) Where the c~iiployer on whom a nolice is served under sub-section (I), 
fails without sufficient cause to pay any sucll amount within the period spcci- 
fied in the ~wtice, lie sha!), without prcjudicc to uny penalty which may he 
imposed on him urlder this Act Le liable to pay to the Board sirnple interest 
on that amount for the period cor~iniencing on the date of expiry of the p e r i d  
specified i n  th: noticc and cnding on dare of the payment of that amount- 

, , 

(a) in r e s ~ c t  of the period h l l i n g  within the first three months after 
such expiry, at the rate of twelve percent p r  annuin, and 

(b) it1 respect of the other pzriod, at the rate of eigliteetl percent per 

(3) The amount of intern1 payable to the Board under sub-section (2) shall 
' Ix collected by the Welfare Commissioner in such manner as may be 

plescribed : 
- 

Provided that the Welfare Comniissioner may, subject to such conditions as 
may be prescribed, remit the whole or any part of the amount of interest in 
respect of any period.". 

dmendment 4. h the principal Act. in section 17,- 
+ of aeotion 17 

of Born. XL, 
o f  1965. - 1 )  aficr thc words "Any sum pnyablo" the words "1; the Board or" shall 

bt inserted; 

(2) in the' marginal note, after the words "sums payable" tho words "to tho 
. Board or" shall be inserted. 

5. In the principal Act, after section 17, the following new sections shall ba 
I naert.ion of 

- new septiom insetted, namely: -- ' . 17h, I7B. 
17Ci  17D 
and 17E . 
in Bom.XL , 

o f  1953. 



PhlCr I V ]  GUJ. GOVP. UAZ., EX., D&CXMUPB 26, ~ ~ W ~ P X U S : %  2, 1902 5s-3 

"l7A. Any employer who fails to pay any anlounr of uupaid acc~lrnukitiam g;f~P 
or hes reafsed from employees or any amount of the employer's or, as the makepap- 

case may be, employee's contributions, wilhin the period spxitiad in a noti= ~;:!;f 

senad on him under sub-section (1) of section 6C. shall, on conviction, be a c c a d e  . 

punishable with imprisonment which may extend to six months or with 
which may extend Ib.o'ne tbousand rupees or with htl~. 

178. Ally omploycr who dcducts the wl~ol& or any part of the cmpioyer's ~y~~~ 
contribution from the wages payable to au employ& or otherwise rccovers it deduction. 

from the employee shall, on convictioa, be punishdable with ~nprisollrnalt 
wh~ch may- exfeud to six inonths or witb fine which may cxtend to on;: 
thousand rupees or wit11 botli. 

, * 

17C. Any person who wilfully obstructs a n  Inspector in the cxcrcise of his P t ~ ~ n l t ~ f o r  ohtruotmng 

powers or discharge of his duties under this Act or fails to produce for inspec- hspectom 

lion on demand by an Itlspcctor any docunlent maiutaitld in pursuance of ercrciaing 
powers or 

the provisions of [his Act or tlte rules made therel~~tdcr ar to supply to him discharging 

on demand true copies of any such dociunent, shall, on convictiun, b: punish- d ~ l ~ i e ~ ~ c t o m  

able- J 

(a) i o ~  the first offence, with imprisonment for a term which m a y  extend 
to three months, or with fine'which may cxtend to five hur~dred rupecs, or 
with both; and 

(b)  for a second or subsequent offences, with imprisonment for a rerm 
which may extend to six mont\ts, or with fine which may ex!end t,> one 
thousand rupes, or with both: 

i Provided that in. the absence of special and adequate reason to the can- 

' . trary to tx. mentioned in the judgement of the Court, in any case where the 
o&nder is  sentenced to a fine only, the anlount of fine shall n o t  be less 
than fifty rupees. 

17D. (1) Where an offence under this Act is cornmilfed by a company ,&a,,,,, 

every person who at the time wllcn the offence was committed was in charge of,,aompadea 

and was responsible to, the .company for ,the conduct of the business of the 
company as well as the company shall be deemed to be guilty of the offence 

. and shall be liable to be proccedd agtllnst and punished accordingly : 

Provided that. nothing contained in this sub-sectiou shall render any such 
person liable to any punishment, if,he proves that the offence was cornmiltad 
without his knowledge or that he had exercised all.due diligence to prevent . 

, the commission of such offence. 

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section ( I ) ,  where an 
offence sunder thi~ Act has been cuimittcd by a company and it ig provcd' f hat 
the offence has been committed witb the consent or connivance of, or is attri- 
butable to, any neglect on the pad of any director, mamger. secretary or other 
ofaoer of the company, such director. manager, secretary or other oaicer shall 
be deemed to be guilty of that ofhoe and shall be liable to bt proceeded 
a g a w  and punished amrdingly. 



58-4 GUJ. GOW.  GAL, EX., DECEMBER 26,1980jPAUSA 6; 1902 [PART IY 

PmvisioUE 
relating to 
jarisdlobion. 

dmendmnl ~t 
of motion 
I0 of 

Exp1mfion.-For the purpose of this section- 

(a) "company" means any body corporate and includes a 6rm or other 
association of individuals; and 

(b) "dimtor" in relation to a firm, means a partner ,in the km. 

17E. ( I )  Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of ~ r i m i n a l ~  Of 
1074r 

P r d u r e ,  1973- 

(a) DO court inferior to that of a ~ e t ; o ~ 3 i t a n  Magistrate or a judicial 
Magistrate i f  the first class shall try any offence punishable under this Act; 
and 

(b) no court sbaU take cognisance of any offence punishable under this 
Act. ,unless a complaint thereof is made within six months of the date an 
whicb the offence is allegd to bave been committed. 

(2) No prosecution for my offence under this Act shall be instituted, by 
any person except an Inspector and no prosecution sha1I be instituted by the 
Inspector except with Ihe previous sanction of the Welfare Commissioner.". 

6. In the principal Act, in section 19,-- 

(1) in sub-section (21, after clause (b), the following clause shill bc-hartrd,  
namely : - 

"(bb) the manner in which the Welfare Commissioner shai collect mder 
sub-section (3) of section 6C the amount of interest payable under sub-section 
(2) of that section to the Board, and the conditions subject to which tha 
Welfare Commissioner may remit the whole or any part of the amount of 
interest under the proviso to subsection (3) of that section:": 

(2) after sub-acclion Q; the following s d - s d ~  shall beinserted, namely: .- 
"(2A) Xn making any rules under this s e c t i q  the State Government may 

direct that a breach thereof shall be punishable with h e  not exceeding two 
thousand rupecs, and when the offence is a continuing one, with a daily 
h e  not exceeding one hundred rupees during the continuance of the 
~ffence .~ .  



Extra No. S 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Vol. XLVT] FRIDAY, FJEBRUARY 25,2005/PHALGUNA, 6,1926 

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it rnay be filed as a Separate Compilation. 

Act of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances Promulgated 
Regulations made by the Governor. 

The Following Act of the Gujarat I~gislature, having been 

assented to by the Governor on the 24h February, 2005 is hereby 
published for general information. 

S. S. PARMAR, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 5 OF 2005. 

(First published, after having received the assent of the 
Governor in the "Gujarat Government Gazette", on the 25& February, 

2005). 

AN ACT 

further to amcnd the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953. 

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of 
India as follows :- 

1. (1)  This Act may be called the Bombay h b o u r  Welfare Short title 

Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2005. 
and comrnenrement. 



GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX., 25-2-2005 [PART IV  

Amendment 
af section 2 of 
Born. XL of 
1953. 

Amendment 
of section 6A 
of lorn. XL 
of 1953. 

Amendment 
of section 6B 
of Born. XI, 
of 1953. 

Hepeal and 

savings. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come in to force on the 

3 1" December, 2004. 

2. In the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953 (hereinafter Bonl.XL 

referred to as "the principal Act"), in section 2,- of f 953. 

(1 ) -  in clause (2), in sub-clause (b), for the words "seven 

hundred and fifty rupees", the words "three thousand 

and five hundred rupees" shall be substituted; 

(2) in clause (lo), for the words "three years", the words 
"one year" shall be substituted. 

3. In  the principal Act, in section 6A,- 

(1) in sub-section ( 5 ) ,  

(i 1 for the words "three years", the words "one 

year" shall be substituted; 

(ii) the words "each year" shall be deleted; 

(2) in sub-section (7), for the words "four years", the 

words "two years" shall be substituted. 

4. In the principal Act, in section 6B, for sub-section (2) ar~d 

provisos thereunder, the following shall be substituted, nameiy:- 

"(2) The amount of employee's cnrltributjon shall be 

payable every six months in respect of every employee whose 

name stands on the register of the establishment concerned 
i n  the month of June, or as the case may be, in the rnorlth of 

December, at the rate of three rupees for each such employee 

and the amount of emplr~yer's contribution shall be payable 

at every six months at the rate of six rupees for'each such 

employee: 

Provided that the State Government may. by 

notification in the OfJicial Gazette, increase the said rate of 
employee's contribution to such amount not exceeding six 

rupees if it considers necessary so to do to enablc the Board 
to fulfill the objects of this Act: 

Provided further that where the sate of employce's 

contribution is so increased by the State Government, the rate 

of employer's contribution shall be twice the rate of 

employee's contribution as so increased.". 

5. ( I )  The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendmerit) Guj- 

Ordinance, 2004 is hereby repealed. 
3 of 2004. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action 

taken under the principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall 

be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as 

amended by this Act. 

~overnment  Central Press, Gandhinagar. 


	1961GUJARAT47.pdf
	Guj-1961-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Extension And Amendment) Act-47.pdf
	Guj-1962-The Bombay Labour Welfare fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-8.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-29.pdf
	Guj-1980-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-36.pdf
	Guj-2005-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-5.pdf


